Our Ref: PTE/SNG9725E/230512/TP-AL IR B TR EE S

Date: 15.06.2023 :i'-"ﬁ‘“n (W

_CAR CASE

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd ComforiDelGio Engineering

Attn  : Motor Claims Department Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT ON 12.05.2023 INVOLVING SNG9725E & GBL6355A ALONG WHITLEY ROAD

We are the authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle No, SNG9725E, which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle No, GBL6355A.

The vehicle owner has requested and authorised us to assist in presenting his/her claims against the 58 Loyan ': '_ :
party responsible for al} applicable matters arising from the damage of the vehicle. bt

As the vehicle was caused by the negligent act of your insured driver, we are submitting these claims
for your consideration on behalf of the the owner/driver/claimant.

1. Cost of Repairs / Exeess S$ 4,614.94
2. Car Rental days x SS$ 0.00 SS 0.00
3. Loss of Use 6 days x S$ 60.00 SS 360.00 .
4. Survey Report Fee s$ 0.00 Pl et
5. LTA Search Fee SS 0.00
6. GIA / Police Report Fee S$ 2.00
7. Medical Expenses SS 0.00
8. Others [1] SS 0.00
9. Others [2] SS 0.00
[E&OE] Total Claims S$ 4,976.94 ... sparKearcars com

A copy each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:

[\/]/ Original Repair/Excess-Bil [d/lnsurance Certificate
[ 1 SurveyReport/ Bill it Power of Attorney
[ ] _ Coloured Photographs [ 1 CarRental Bili
[\/]/ GIA/Police Report(s) [ 1 Medical Bill

[]

[~ GIA/TP Search Witness Statement

[ 1 Others:

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our clients' claims as soon
as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours sincerely,

Alice Lau

CDGE Claims Department

DID:62148307 FAX: - Email:alicelau@cdge.com.sg

This is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A member of

COMFORIDELGRO



6/9/23, 9:36 AM Mail - Kristy Tay Siew Hwa - Outlook

Re: FINALISE / SNG9725E / DOA 12.05.2023

Kelvin Su Khai Wen
Fri 9/6/2023 8:40 AM

To:Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc:Spark Car Care <SparkARC@comfortdelgro.com>;Kristy Tay Siew Hwa
<kristytay@sparkcarcare.com>;0i Sun Pin <OiSunPin@cdge.com.sg>

Dear Kenneth,

Finalised Amount confirmed.Thankyou.

Best Regards,

Kelvinw Sw
Customer Care Specialist(Accident Repair)
T: 63837890

_//" == &

SPARH

CAR CARE

i

L Y L i e s i

205 Braddell Rd, Singapore 579701

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 8:38 am

To: Kelvin Su Khai Wen <kelvinsukwen@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Spark Car Care <SparkARC@comfortdelgro.com>; Kristy Tay Siew Hwa <kristytay@sparkcarcare.com>; Oi
Sun Pin <0iSunPin@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FINALISE / SNGS725E / DOA 12.05.2023

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or

open attachment unlegsfﬁ%\cm the sender.

I see, okay confinm $4273.09 B4 exdess subject to insurance approval thanks.

From: Kelvin Su Khai Wen <kelvinsukwen@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 9 June 2023 8:34am

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Spark Car Care <SparkARC@comfortdelgro.com>; Kristy Tay Siew Hwa <kristytay@sparkcarcare.com>; Oi
Sun Pin <OiSunPin@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: FINALISE / SNG9725E / DOA 12.05.2023

Hi Kenneth,

Is that the different on the S/N item? (Rear Bumper Clips)

https://outiook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMKADQ4N]M5YTZLTYwOTMINDZhYi1 iYWVkLWZiYZFmNDQWYWE4OQBGAAAAAAD%2demungV. .. 1/5



COMFORTDELGRO

I

NGINEERIN G wm———

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd Tax Invoice
205 Braddell Road, Singapore 579701 - _
T: +65 6383 8110 Invoice No: 94103447
Company Reg. No. 199506048W Invoice Date: 09.05.2023
GST Reg. No. M2-8921817-3 Payment Term: 30 days
Customer ID: 8010002 Vehicle No.:  SNG9725E
Customer: ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Make/Model: NISSAN SERENA

Mileage: -
Address: ROBINSON ROAD #09-01 #79 Job No.: 305555757

SG 068897 Date/Time In:  25.05.2023 09:51

Date/Time Out: 03.06.2023 00:00

S/INO DESCRIPTION QTY UNIT PRICE NET PRICE
01 REAR BUMPER 1 1,374.39 1,374.39
02 TAILGATE 1 1,692.90 1,692.90
03 TAILGATE EMBLEM HGHWAY 1 51.30 51.30
STAR

04 EMBLEM EPOWER 1 94.50 94.50
05 CLIPS X 10 1 50.00 50.00
06 LABOUR CHARGES 1 1,010.00 1,010.00

TOTAL AMOUNT SGD 4,273.09

ADD 8% GST SGD 341.85

NET AMOUNT PAYABLE SGD 4,614.94

Invoice No.: 94103447 Net Payable: 4,614.94 Payment Due

Cheque should be crossed and made payable to 'ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd'

PayNow Bank Account Details
1. Open your mobile banking a
2 Sglecty'Scan and Pay’ SRR Account: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
3. Key in invoice amount Bank: DBS Bank Ltd
4. Under transaction description, Account No.: 001-069544-4

key in the tax invoice number

Terms & Conditions:

*  Customers shall inspect their vehicles upon collection and advise the company of any complaints before leaving the workshop.
Otherwise, the vehicle(s) will be deemed to have been accepted in good order.
Customer shall check this invoice upon receipt and advise the company of any errors or discrepancies before payment is made,
Interest of 1% per month will be charged on a day-to-day basis on the amount due and owing to the company by the payment due date.

PARE- 1 NF 1




INSURER ENQUIRY #% RESULT & RECEIPT

Find
Insurer TP Insurer Enquiry
Vehicle reg. no.
Insurance ... Allianz Insurance Singapore P...
GBL6355A
Period of INSUrANCE ..o 03/12/2022 - 02/12/2023
Date of Accident
Requested By Huang Xiao Yan (COMFORTDEL...
12/05/2023 & Requested Date ... 22/05/2023 13:56
Reset
Payment details General Insurance Association
Request Amount: $$1.85 Records Management Centre
GST Amount: §$0.15 GST Registration No: M400017735

Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive): $$2



SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Ploke concely repmt the detatls of she accidont to speaid g the el JEX AN

2 Thse Versi swist be comploted by the Policyholder andior the Authorized Oriver.

3 Inforsrad ki pravided st be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any willk siivepresentation of withhoking of siatens] facts mayatiow
s coanpanics o repudiate policy liability

4 The kone and acosptance of this Formm by nsirancs compaies & sist ag pdinsssion of polioy Jabsliry o the part of $he msuranee aomnpaniss

© Any false reporling may be referred to the Police for investigation.

nxu

& Mz repoat will be forwarded by the Dsurers of the GIA Records Manspement Centre svtaldishied by the Genorl Innrance Associslion of Singagacs
I1AY Tor archiving and that capies of this vepers will fae 2 foe be mude avatlahls igron apphication Tev Mutereded partics.

7 By fhe Jodpoent of (his repont wothe smers, von horehy comsan toabe mehiving of this sepot a1 the enuser and to eopies of the report oy
wade avnthble aloresaid,

£ Congent under the Personat Data Protection Act{PDPA)

| undeysiang, ashonewledos, anree and cousent that

o Myinera ey worsbop ad fhe Garau) hsusete Assonaton of Swpspote ["BIA) mayae panned lo celledt, e, disclose andior provas
sz personal data perseral loformauon set oul i thie [ o] and amy other parsenal infuvnatcs provaded by me o possessed by toe manver (colleotrve e
tus “Personat Information”) and disclose and iesfer sueh Pasonal Tifboaatias o all eusat’s) sl bave maned vduclels) involy of &1 i

accidant (all siomreris) whe hase meured vclizctedsy invalsed i this secident shati be colicaiivzlves (azod tn as the *fAsUrers™, e fusurore® fveyersTaw
4 b . 3

Ezie, the Metetary Antherty of Sigapore and any relevnnt govasmient ageanovautiorsy [suel as (he pobe), for the papose(st of :

4 processag. Nasdlog sedior dealing witk vy clalin hcluding the setilemas of the eluan wid sy neesnay ivesipations rdstag 1o Nie chinss,

i) eareying ook and'or dealing wish oy sstrogtions or responding tosny enqaires by me

a0 adamistering sy shis {incfuding the maifing of eomespordence, statamonts. inveices, vepoizic or netiges W e, whicl could nwivedisclomre
of cortam pasoml s dbows me 1o lirteeg bl delivery of the sanie as well as onthe extemed cover of arelgpesimagl gackages); andior

£ conphving with appBeable w m aduiinsrering proccssmy. handlog andior deabing woh my elans.

{Uollcancly the “Purposes’]

2 allinswseisyaho have annred veliete(s) velved s this aceident wd shie Lusuzas' bowvers L (s, ouiylare peamtted Lo eolleet. usediseime
and oy proces 1y Parsonal Inleanation for one ar mere of e above Parposes; and

&)y Pevwoinnl Tofevnation wweeoun be daciosal by mny of the Tnsuras md o GA Lo their thicd-paty servive pronsdens se apetalineluding

ther lawyers 2w fisins). wined niay beseod ausssde of Sirapore. fior one re nors of the abave Puposss.

Palieyholdars Signature 7 Date & Dirtvers Sipnature {1 dervar (s aae (ee policylaodda) ¢ Dnleks Winessed by Repotting CentreP ssanne)
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SKETCH PLAN #2

Describa Cireumgtanees of he Accident

ON 12/05/2023 AT ABOUT 1810HRS | WAS DRIVING VEHICLE A (SNG9725E)
ALONG WHITLEY ROAD ON THE MOST RIGHT LANE. WHILE WAITING AT THE
TRAFFIC LIGHT TO TURN RIGHT, VEHICLE B(GBL6355A) REAR ENDED ME.

NO OTHER VEHICLES INVOLVED
NOBODY WAS INJURED

Declaration

1V e doclare the Guegoing parclis are e m cvay respeet,
Zome ¥ e

Y Y /4

Voheyhollers Sigarature / Tate & Driva's Signanue 3 driver & not the polieyholder) / Dated Wilpessed by Repectmp CavirgPersaune]
3 P y Repecimp

Time T 12/05/2023 2250HRS DHIYAA
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

A member of COMFORIDLI GRO

POWER OF ATTORNEY
. ‘ g;a; 5 Z‘??‘\)dr""gf ' , .
A CIDEN@Z INVOLVING (Own &s%ehlcle No.) y E?fi (Third Party’sVehicle No.)
Gl CISKE o S /22 atong 04 7 L&Y I<07A7)

Policy Nos: DI&MFL 0002414~ 03

BY THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY, *I!WGW/‘&%{/@@ @LY 4 @7{) P/L*NRIC/PE\SSDOH

No. (Address)*

/ a company

incorporate in Singapore and having its registered office at (Address)* 204" QQM 'Q"é“/ G 1:717 7o/

[4 1
owner of Vehicle Registered No. ~S)/Ud7 é% %—é

hereby irrevocably appoint ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (CDGE), a

company incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at__ 20X~ fy)?‘ha@éﬂ ﬁoq/ Sg &7 "7?‘0/

its agents or any person authorized by CDGE to be *my/our Attomey and in *my/our name(s) and on *my/our behalf
to do all or any of the following:

1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings) which *l/we may
have against the other *party/parties to the Accident and under the insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or altematively under Insurance Policy No. taken up by *me/us in respect
of the cost of repairs, loss of use and at all other costs and expenses, etc. suffered by *me/us arising from the
Accident (loss and damage).

2. Forthe purpose of such claim(s) as aforesaid, to appoint solicitors on *my/our behalf as * my/our Attomey shall in his absolute
discretion, deem fit.

3. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to be made
by way of cheque in favor of ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd , CDGE and to give a valid receipt and discharge
therefor.

4. For any of the purposes aforesaid, to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in relation thereto.
5. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of CDGE.

*I/We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this Power of Attorney on *my/our

behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person authorized by CDGE in that behalf shall be as good valid and effectual
to all intents and purposes whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by *me/us in *my/our own proper
{Jerson(s) and *I/We hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or executed by virtue of
he authority and powers hereby conferred.

*I/We hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

*I/We further confirm that the acceptance by CDGE of the settlement amount in respect of such constitute the full discharge
of my/our claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

+
*IN WITNESS WHEREOF. *I/We have hereunto to set *my/our hand and seal this day—Ig— of the month of
/\//ﬁ“‘(j‘ , Year Two Thousand -'—(ZOAB)

Signed, Sealed livered By

Customers Name:
NRIC No.:
Co’s rubber Stamp
delete as appropriate. File



