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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Chang <janice@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 June 2023 6:02 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SNH9266H & AIG INSURED SCZ6698A 

ON 22/05/2023 *** lkk ref: CC6/AIG23005197/ya3
Attachments: SNH9266H - LOD.pdf

Hi, 
 
We refer to the above & have finalized with your surveyor. 
 
Here is our LOD: 
Cost of Repair – S$10,152.00 
Loss of Use      - S$1,350.00 ($150 x 9days) 
Search Fee      - S$2.00 
Towing            - S$80.00 
Total                - S$11,584.00 
 
 
The attached is our invoice & related document. 
Please look into it & let us have your offer. 
Hope to hear from you soon. 
Thank You. 
 
 
Best Regards 
____________________________________________ 
Janice Chang | Senior Admin 
 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 
 
-All offers/acceptances are made, based without prejudice.- 
 
 
 

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, May 24, 2023 3:31 PM 
To: SATM ADMIN <admin@sngahtee.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR CLIENT'S VEH SNH9266H & AIG INSURED SCZ6698A ON 22/05/2023 *** lkk ref: 
CC6/AIG23005197/ya3 
 
Without Prejudice 










