Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 22 May 2023 9:03 AM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: FW: 2023 32008070/JK - SLZ4411S - DOA: 4.5.2023 - OD claim
Attachments: image001.png; FW: 2023 32008070/JK - SLZ4411S - DOA: 4.5.2023 - OD claim
Hi

Kindly assist.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 19, 2023 6:43 PM

To: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <janice.koh@allianz.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@Ikkauto.com>; Henry Lee (Ding Auto)
<sa0406@dingauto.sg>; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>; Edmund Choy (Ding Auto)
<estimator@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding Auto) <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Subject: Re: FW: 2023 32008070/JK - SLZ4411S - DOA: 4.5.2023 - OD claim

Dear Janice,

Good day to you.

We will arrange towing tomorrow.

Thank you so much.

Best Regards,

Kenneth Ding



On Fri, 19 May 2023, 6:22 pm Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore), <janice.koh@allianz.sg> wrote:

Internal

@admin-a@lkkauto.com

Please assist to conduct physical survey for the mention vehicle.

To liaise with Kenneth from Ding Auto. @Kenneth Ding

Vehicle will only be towed out from KFS > Ding Auto tomorrow.

Thank you

Janice Koh

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C

79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sq

Planned Leave: 15 June — 15" June 2023

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient,
please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



From: Koh, Janice (Allianz Insurance Singapore)

Sent: 19 May, 2023 04:04 PM

To: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Low, Wai Hoe <w.low@controlexpert.com>; cesgclaims
<cesgclaims@controlexpert.com>

Subject: 2023 32008070/JK - SLZ4411S - DOA: 4.5.2023 - OD claim

Importance: High

Hi Kenneth,

As spoken please submit OD claim via Merimen.

We will be appointing CE for for desktop survey. You may liaise with them at your end.

@Low, Wai Hoe @cesgclaims cesgclaims@controlexpert.com

please take note vehicle be will towed out from Kan Fook Sing to Ding Auto.




Thank you

Janice Koh

Claims Specialist

Claims & Performance Management

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01, Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sq

Planned Leave: 1% June — 15" June 2023

I

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient,
please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

4 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.



