Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 July 2023 9:17 AM

To: Claim@CentralAuto

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ4762Y E AND GBF2967S ALONG 6 CHIN BEE AVE,LEVEL 5

SINGAPORE 619930 DOA: 02.02.23

Hi Sam,
As per our message

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,500.00 /- with 06 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

= Save the ELarth- Print only wherr necessary-

From: Claim@CentralAuto <claim@centralauto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 2:28 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YQ4762Y E AND GBF2967S ALONG 6 CHIN BEE AVE,LEVEL 5 SINGAPORE 619930 DOA:
02.02.23

Dear Rasul,
Attached herewith after repaired photo for your preparation.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Sam Tan

G

Central Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Sunview Road, #08-44 Ecotech@Sunview S627615
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