Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 19 May 2023 4:35 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Charandeep Singh; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10022361/CD|| OI-SNB5187K (GREY) TP-SLE86J || Est: $4,071.87 || ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE LTD
Attachments: C10022361 - TP - SLE86J.zip

Hi Team,

We wish to appoint LKK to conduct survey for the TP vehicle number: SLES6)J

Please kindly take note that the officer in-charge is Mr. @Charandeep Singh , who is copied in the email.
We appreciate if you can keep him in the loop.

ALAN'S UNITED AUTO PTE.

Block 7, Sin Ming Industrial Estate, #01-76, Singapore 575642,

Please find attached GIA reports for your reference.

Thank you.
Best regards,

Maybie Chua
Admin Executive, Claims

F +65 6725 0853
E maybie.chua@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays te choose -

BudgEt P.Iatir-mm Trusted

Dlrect Service Award
Nsurance | -o:s feefo



From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 May 2023 3:55 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request On 17-05-2023 | | Ourf: C10022361/CD || SLE86J ,CLAIMING SNB5187K ON 17-05-2023

Dear Person In-Charge
We like to let LKK to conduct the survey thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Itd
64538686

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 May 2023 2:01 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ARRANGE T. P. SURVEY FOR SLE86J ,CLAIMING SNB5187K ACCIDENT ON 17-05-2023

Dear Motor Claims Dept.
Please arrange surveyor to survey our client vehicle SLE86J for t. p. claim your insured vehicle SNB5187K accident on 17-05-2023 thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



