EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 5 July 2023 10:22 am

Jason Ang

Admin A

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 8889Y AND SLX 3138Z ON 03/05/2023 11:15
ALONG/AT EAST COAST ROAD

LKK Survey Photos.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Jason,

We refer to your email below.

Please be informed that we have received third party claim. Please find enclosed sketch plan & police report’s
statement of third party :-

Skelch Plan
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Brief Details

e
n

I was parking along EAST COAST ROAD at 8 30am, on 3 May 2023. at 1.40pm whenicame b
my car i1 realize my right side mirrer have been damaged.

i start to trace back my CARCAM and realize it was a hit and run by a car plate number SLUBS!
MERCEDES GLC at 11.15am base on the car cam recording lime

Based on third party report, damage is on right portion, pls find damage photos enclosed taken by our surveyor during
Pre-repair inspection.

We have requested video footage form third party workshop and pending to receive it.

We are sorry that we are unable to provide third party’s contact number due to PDPA. If you wish to private settle, you
may contact AlG. (after settlement insured may contact insurer.)

We urgently require your co-operation to lodge police report (third party has reported to police) and GIA accident
report (AlG on-line reporting). Pls provide your statement on this accident.
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You will require evidence to proof if there is a fraudulent claim.
If you have further enquiry, pls don’t hesitate to contact me via whatsapp at 80287880. Thank you.
*| am working from home till 07.07.2023. If you wish to contact me, pls whatsapp call at 80287880 or email.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jason Ang <jasonangbk@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 12:50 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 8889Y AND SLX 3138Z ON 03/05/2023 11:15 ALONG/AT EAST COAST ROAD
SECOND EMAIL (FIRST EMAIL SENT 9 DAYS AGO)

Hi there,

We spoken on the phone.

1) | expect to know the extend of the damage on the other party

2) If there are any video footage to proof the damage

3) And the other party contact details so that | can do a private settlement with them amicably

| am afraid that they will do a fraudulent claim and | will exercise my rights to a fair judgement.

Best Regards,

Jason Ang

On Mon, Jun 26, 2023 at 10:28 PM Jason Ang <jasonangbk@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi there,

We spoken on the phone.

1) | expect to know the extend of the damage on the other party

2) If there are any video footage to proof the damage

3) And the other party contact details so that | can do a private settlement with them amicably

| am afraid that they will do a fraudulent claim and | will exercise my rights to a fair judgement.

Please advise.



Best Regards,

Jason Ang

On Tue, Jun 20, 2023 at 5:33 PM Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC6/AIG23005092/Aya3

AIG Ref: 0650495919SG

JASON ANG BOON KIAT
327 HOUGANG AVENUE 5
#04-166

SINGAPORE 530327

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLU 8889Y AND SLX 3138Z ON 03/05/2023 11:15 ALONG/AT EAST COAST ROAD

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance
Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD-PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date
and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this letter, giving the version of the
accident amongst other things related to the accident. The GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres.
You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the undersigned within five days from
the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc would be affected.



Yours faithfully,

p

Ezlyna
Claims
Tel : 6841 6051

Email : Ezlyna@lkkauto.com

c.c. Claims Manager
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

(Motor Claims Dept)



