Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 18 May 2023 12:40 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Teo Jie Yang

Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10022356 /JY || Ol- SJE6301Y (Silver) TP-SLP855Z || Est: $0.00 || Guan Motor Works
Attachments: C10022356 (TP-SLP855Z).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP PRS for SLP855Z. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
Please be informed that our insured has yet to report the accident.

Workshop information:
Address:

Venue | ;| Guan Motor Works
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03
Sin Ming AutoCare

Singapore 575721
Tel RAR2 A111 (AH HENRY

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: Willow Tuang <wtuang@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2023 11:15 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRS Request on 17.05.2023 || C10022356/JY | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP855Z & SJE6301Y ON 12/06/2023 ALONG BUKIT TIAMH ROAD
Without Prejudice

Dear Sir

We refer to your email of even date.



We are agreeable of appointing LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD as the Single Joint Expert.

Our client’s vehicle is available for pre-repair survey at:

Venue | : [ Guan Motor Works
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03
Sin Ming AutoCare
Singapore 575721
Tel: 6453 6111 (AH HENG)

Regards

Tuang Willow

for CK TEO & CO
Tel: 65354788
Fax: 65354245

From: Willow Tuang <wtuang@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 17, 2023 11:52 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLP855Z & SJE6301Y ON 12/06/2023 ALONG BUKIT TIAMH ROAD

Dear Sir,

Enclosed is a copy each of the following:

a. Notification of Accident & Pre-Repair Inspection;
b. GIA Report of our Client; and

c. LTAresult

Regards



Tuang Willow
for CK TEO & CO
Tel: 65354788
Fax: 65354245



