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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 28 July 2023 10:43 AM
To: tanwancong@tokiomarine.com.sg
Subject: RE: Your Ref: M2302820 // LKK REF: CC2/MIDA23005077/p [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 

MID59122 AND GBF1478T ON 03/05/2023]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that TCA is not applicable as your insured vehicle repair cost is 
more than $10K. 
 
In view of this, we are unable to look into your claim. Thanks. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, July 21, 2023 3:49 PM 
To: tanwancong@tokiomarine.com.sg 
Subject: Your Ref: M2302820 // LKK REF: CC2/MIDA23005077/p [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID59122 AND GBF1478T 
ON 03/05/2023] 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military 
vehicles with effect from December 2021. 
 
We will look into the matter and get back to you. 
 
Thanks. 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 


