Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 5 July 2023 9:46 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLF 1315L Finalize calculation and discharge photos

From: HK Ong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 July 2023 9:46:17 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Suanne Chiu' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
<siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 1315L Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Rasul,
We accept your offer @ L/Sum $5,350.00 with 6 days.
Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 9:32 AM

To: HK Ong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Cc: 'Suanne Chiu' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Jlia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLF 1315L Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Hi Ong,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $5,350.00 /- with 06 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Larth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: HK Ong <hk.ong@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 May 2023 10:01 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Suanne Chiu' <suann@mova.com.sg>; 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>
Subject: SLF 1315L Finalize calculation and discharge photos

Dear Rasul,

Attached finalize calculation and discharge photos for your attention.
Kindly assist to finalize as vehicle been discharged.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Ong



