Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 15 May 2023 3:14 pm

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Jason Tea Chee Kiat

Subject: TPPD PRI survey: C10022137/JT || Ol- SGP404B (White) TP-SMJ6509D || Est: $0.00 || Fix Auto Pte Ltd
Attachments: SKV617A C10022137.zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SMJ6509D. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:

Registered Address
5 SO0ON LEE STREET

#01-61
PIONEER POINT

Best Regards
Chris Chan

FIX ALUTO PTE LTD
HP:92712214

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.

Leong Eng Ming
Administrative Claims Assistant

T +65 6989 3706
F +65 6725 0853
E engming.leong@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, May 15, 2023 11:27 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 15.05.2023 || C10022137/JT || SMJ6509D & SGP404B Doa 5/5/23

Dear Sir/ Mdm
LKK Auto consultant P/ L. Thanks
Best Regards

Chris Chan
Fix Auto Pte Ltd



Hp:92712214

Get Outlook for iOS

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, May 13, 2023 10:04 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: SMJ6509D & SGP404B Doa 5/5/23

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is our client GIA report .
Please let us have your 10 name list of surveyor to survey our client vehicle : SMJ6509D . Thanks

Best Regards
Chris Chan

FIX AUTO PTE LTD
HP:92712214

Get Outlook for iOS



