Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 June 2023 12:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fwd: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23
Attachments: LOA.pdf; log card.pdf; INVOICE.pdf; GIA.pdf

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 3:32 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Enclosed is the GIA ,LOA |, invoice, LTA fee
As request following :

1)RC $ 4600.00 ( - As agreed )

2) loss of rental $ 960.00 ( $120- 1800cc above x- 6 days recommend + 1 days waiting
period + 1 day weeekend - total 8 days )

3) Ita fee $26.75

@ 100% ( Chain collision )

TOTAL $5586.75/-

Please let us have your settlement soon . Thanks

Best Regards

Chris Chan

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
HP: 92712214



