6/29/23, 11:46 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Thu 29/6/2023 11:46 AM
To:chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Cc:Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICFE’

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at $$5,100.00(all- in) in
full and final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or
their insured arising out of this incident.

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization /
Warrant to Act and your Bank details for us to process payment.

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full
discharge of liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz
Insurance Singapore and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 25 APRIL 2023.

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment
or payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 June 2023 8:33 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

Dear Hsiao Tong .
Accept . DV please . Thanks

Get Outlook for iOS

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2023 8:26:11 AM

To: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

Without Prejudice
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Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,100.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 12:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 6, 2023 3:32 PM

To: Claims Banca (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Subject: Fwd: SKW6777B & SFL7373T DOA 25.4.23

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Enclosed is the GIA ,LOA |, invoice, LTA fee
As request following :

1)RC $ 4600.00 ( - As agreed )

2) loss of rental $ 960.00 ( $120- 1800cc above x- 6 days recommend + 1 days waiting
period + 1 day weeekend - total 8 days )

3) Ita fee $26.75

@ 100% ( Chain collision )

TOTAL $5586.75/-

Please let us have your settlement soon . Thanks
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Best Regards

Chris Chan

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
HP: 92712214
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