Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 July 2023 5:06 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; SUR

Subject: RE: OREF; 22/23/23/VC05/027385 - FW: LOD & final Invoice for Accident Involving
GBK3632A and FW463E on 08 May 2023

Attachments: Preliminary Advice.PDF

Dear Gerald,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle FW 463E
Date of survey: 12/05/2023
Number of days (estimated) : 4 days

Best Regards,

Celine Fong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 12:36 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; erofia@singnet.com.sg

Subject: OREF; 22/23/23/VC05/027385 - FW: LOD & final Invoice for Accident Involving GBK3632A and FW463E on
08 May 2023

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Meng Yan,

Please forward the email to the case handler.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Erofia Motor - LeeLee Tan <erofia@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, July 5, 2023 12:16 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: LOD & final Invoice for Accident Involving GBK3632A and FW463E on 08 May 2023

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam

With reference to the above mentioned

Attached LOD & Invoice for your early process of our claim
Thank you

Regards

LeelLee Tan

Erofia Motor Trading Pte Ltd

Tel: 67527740
Fax: 67528669

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



