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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 5:29 pm
To: assignments
Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300347H/ST | 02. TPPD - SKX2270S | KC Ref: REF: L23.0361.cj | Accdt invlvg SNJ5445Z (ECICS-NR) & SKX2270S 

(PHV) along Orchard Road on 06/05/2023 03:05
Attachments: 23 0361 PR.pdf

Hi Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please arrange to survey SKX2270S on a without prejudice basis. 
 
Attached copy of TP police report for your perusal. 
 
Best regards                                                          

Sharon Tan 

Team Lead 

  

  
DID (65) 6303 0167                          Tel (65) 6206 5588                                            
Email Sharon_Tan@ecics.com.sg     Web www.ecics.com.sg                          
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600 
From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 4:04 PM 
To: Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg> 
Subject: EL Ref: DMPC2300347H/ST | 02. TPPD - SKX2270S | KC Ref: REF: L23.0361.cj | Accdt invlvg SNJ5445Z (ECICS) & SKX2270S (PHV) along Orchard Road on 
06/05/2023 03:05 
 
Dear Sirs 
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We refer to your email of 9 May 2023 
  
Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor(s) as the SJE:  LKK Auto Consultants.  

Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client’s vehicle at the following address:    

TK Motor Workshop 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-56 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
 
Ah Keong / 96273323 
 
Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair survey within 2 working days of his 
appointment. 
  
Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey(s). 
  
As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should you reach a direct settlement with our 
client’s repairer.  
  
Regards 
Irene 
Kuru & Co  
150 South Bridge Road 
#04-06 Fook Hai Building 
Singapore 058727 
Tel: 6532 2009  
Fax: 6532 2007 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information and/or may be subjected to legal 
privilege. If you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information 
contained herein.   
 
 
On Tuesday, 9 May 2023 at 03:28:04 pm SGT, Sharon Tan Chow Yen <sharon_tan@ecics.com.sg> wrote:  
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Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Sirs, 

  

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated May 9, 2023. 

  

Please be informed our insured have not lodge the accident. 

  

Meanwhile, we intend to conduct a pre-repair inspection of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. 

  

We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the list appended below to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert. 

1.     Ajax Inspection Services Pte Ltd 

2.     Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd 

3.     Infiniti Appraisal Services  

4.     LKK Auto Consultants  

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert. 

We will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the joint expert. 

  

Best regards                                                          

Sharon Tan 
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Team Lead 

  

  

DID (65) 6303 0167                          Tel (65) 6206 5588                                            

Email Sharon_Tan@ecics.com.sg     Web www.ecics.com.sg                          

Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #09-04A, Singapore 408600 

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 12:45 PM 
To: motorsurvey <motorsurvey@ecics.com.sg>; ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>; Nicholas Chua Kian Soon (ECICS Claims) 
<nicholas_chua@ecics.com.sg>; Jarius Tan <Jarius_Tan@ecics.com.sg> 
Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY // OUR REF: L23.0361.cj // YR REF: SNJ 5445Z // ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2270S AND SNJ 5445Z ON 06/05/2023 

  

On Tuesday, 9 May 2023 at 09:32:18 am SGT, Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg> wrote:  

  

Dear Sirs, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKX 2270S AND SNJ 5445Z ON 06/05/2023 

AT/ALONG ORCHARD ROAD 

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY 

We act for Chua Tian Siang, whose vehicle registration number SKX 2270S was damaged in the above accident.  
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A copy of our client’s Police report is enclosed. 

Before our client proceeds with repairs, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct a 
pre-repair survey. 

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed with repairs without further reference to you. 

  

Regards 

Irene 

Kuru & Co  
150 South Bridge Road 
#04-06 Fook Hai Building 
Singapore 058727 
Tel: 6532 2009  

Fax: 6532 2007 

  

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If 
you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained 
herein.   

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, 
accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his 
message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained 
herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited. 
 

  

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, 
accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his 
message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained 
herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited. 
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This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, 
accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee indicated in his 
message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained 
herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited. 
 

 


