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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: jiapei <jiapei@kscgp.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 July 2023 1:25 PM
To: Gnoh, Pau Loong; Renee Sia (LKK Auto); SUR
Subject: Re: Your Ref-JP/DS/23/2869/SLC ; LKK ref : CS3/SMO23004042/Kvy3m ; Sompo Ref-

CMTD2301536/GPL | Your Insured-SMV 2939J ; -ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 6709U, 
SMV 2939J AND SLR 3728C ALONG KPE TOWARDS PAYA LEBAR ON 15.04.2023

Dear Sirs,  
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We regret that despite reasonable effort having been made to settle our client’s claim, there does not 
appear to be any reasonable prospects of settlement. 
 
We hereby give you 10 clear days’ notice that our client intends to proceed with the issue of an originating 
claim against your insured. In this regard, please let us know if you are instructing solicitors to accept 
service of process on your insured’s behalf. 
 
 
 
Thank you and best regards,  
Hue Jiapei   
M/s KSCGP Juris LLP 
Tel: 6538 3611 / DID: 3152 0985 
Fax: 6538 3708 
E-mail: jiapei@kscgp.com 
 
KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited Liability 
Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity 
to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be protected by legal privilege. If you 
are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by return email, delete this message and you should 
not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained herein. Please note that e-mails are susceptible to change 
and we shall not be liable for the improper or incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication 
nor for any delay in its receipt or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that the integrity of this communication 
has been maintained nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference. 
 

From: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg> 
Sent: 08 May 2023 08:45 
To: Support Accident <support.accident@kscgp.com>; Renee Sia (LKK Auto) <reneesia@lkkauto.com>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: jiapei <jiapei@kscgp.com>; Motor Claims <motorclaims@kscgp.com> 
Subject: Your Ref-JP/DS/23/2869/SLC ; LKK ref : CS3/SMO23004042/Kvy3m ; Sompo Ref-CMTD2301536/GPL | Your 
Insured-SMV 2939J ; -ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKS 6709U, SMV 2939J AND SLR 3728C ALONG KPE TOWARDS PAYA 
LEBAR ON 15.04.2023  
  
Dear M/s KSCGP, 
  
With reference to your email below, we acknowledge receipt of your documents and we will be conducting 
the resurvey and have email copy M/s LKK for this matter. 
  
Kindly hold hands as we will revert as soon as possible, thank you. 
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Dear M/s LKK Auto ( for your ref : CS3/SMO23004042/Kvy3m ), 
  
Please assist above as enclosed document and kindly revert by email, thank you. 
  

Best Regards 

Mr Gnoh Pau Loong 

Claims Division 

D: 6329 5217 | T: 6461 6555   

  

  

 
  

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.           
50 Raffles Place, #03-03, Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623 
Website: www.sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompoSG  

  

  

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential 
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message. 

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes 
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom 
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for 
our Privacy Policy. 

  

From: Support Accident <support.accident@kscgp.com>  
Sent: Friday, May 5, 2023 4:27 PM 
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg> 
Cc: jiapei <jiapei@kscgp.com>; Motor Claims <motorclaims@kscgp.com> 
Subject: LOC- Your Ref-CMTD2301536/GPL | Your Insured-SMV 2939J | Our Ref-JP/DS/23/2869/SLC-ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SKS 6709U, SMV 2939J AND SLR 3728C ALONG KPE TOWARDS PAYA LEBAR ON 15.04.2023 
  

CAUTION:  This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this sender (Email) before replying or clicking on 
any links and open attachments. 

Dear Sirs,  
  
We refer to the above matter.  
  
We enclose herein our letter of claim with supporting documents dated 05 May 2023 for your attention.  
  
Kindly acknowledge receipt.  
  
Best Regards, 
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John 
For and on behalf of Ms Hue Jiapei 
KSCGP Juris LLP 
133 New Bridge Road 
#17-03 Chinatown Point 
Singapore 059413 
Tel: 6538 3611 / Fax: 6538 3708 
Email: support.accident@kscgp.com 
  
KSCGP Juris LLP (UEN/Registration No: T10LL1855L) is registered in Singapore under the Limited 
Liability Partnerships Act (Chapter 163A) with limited liability. This message is intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity to whom it is addressed (including any attachments) and is confidential and may be 
protected by legal privilege. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by 
return email, delete this message and you should not disseminate, distribute or copy any information 
contained herein. Please note that emails are susceptible to change and we shall not be liable for the improper 
or incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its receipt 
or damage to your system. We do not guarantee that the integrity of this communication has been maintained 
nor that this communication is free of viruses, interceptions or interference.   
  


