Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 May 2023 10:18 am

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Don Bong; Ng Chen How

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10021011 /CH || OI-SNA9686R (White) TP-FBQ4557X || Est: $0.00 || KY Auto PL
Attachments: C10021011 - TP (FBQ4557X).zip

Dear Derrick / Kenneth / Don,
TP survey for FBQ4557X. TP choose LKK to survey the motorbike.

Workshop:

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.
25 EARI BUEIT ROAD
#05-23 SYNERGYREB
SINGRPORE 417800

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: KY AUTO <kyautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, May 5, 2023 9:54 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 04.05.2023 || C10021011/CH || Survey Request || ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBQ4557X (ETIQA) CLAIMING AGAINST SNA9686R (AUTO
& GENERAL) ON 10/03/2023

Dear Claims,

We can proceed with LKK for PRI.

Best Regards,



Isabella

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-23 SYNERGYQKB
SINGAPORE 417800

HP: 98073304/81898979

From: KY AUTO <kyautosg@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 4, 2023 3:22 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Survey Request | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBQ4557X (ETIQA) CLAIMING AGAINST SNA9686R (AUTO & GENERAL) ON 10/03/2023

Dear Motor Claims Department,
Kindly assist to arrange for Survey Before Repair and let us have the liability for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Isabella

KY AUTO PTE. LTD.

25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
#05-23 SYNERGYQKB
SINGAPORE 417800

HP: 98073304/81898979






