Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 31 May 2023 10:28 AM
To: SUR; CS A Team
Subject: FW: Reminder: SMU4902G FINALISE

From: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg <rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 May 2023 10:27:42 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Reminder: SMU4902G FINALISE

Without Prejudice,

Dear Rasul,

NOTED: this case is under Lumpsum repair.

We agreed to accept to your finalise amount at Lumpsum $3,850.00 before GST & 6 repair days (Excluding
PRS/RS/Weekend/PH).

Thank you

Best Regards,

Minoko Chan
R&S Autoclaim Pte. Ltd.
13 Pioneer Sector 1 Singapore 628424

7%:+65 6264 7001 | HP: +65 8506 6490 | &: 6264 7002

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 May 2023 10:25 am

To: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Reminder: SMU4902G FINALISE

sorry typo error should be lump sum repair

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- FPrint only whenr necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 31 May 2023 10:22 am

To: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg <rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg>
Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Reminder: SMU4902G FINALISE

Hi Minoko,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $3,850.00 /- with 06 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=] Save the Larth- FPrint only whenr necessary-

From: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg <rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 26 May 2023 12:37 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Reminder: SMU4902G FINALISE




Without Prejudice,

Dear Rasul,

Reminder.

Please refer to attachments, kindly check & confirm finalize COR @ lumpsum $3,900.00 (before GST) & 6 repair days
(excluding PRS/RS/WEEKEND/PH).

Kindly check & revert ASAP.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Minoko Chan
R&S Autoclaim Pte. Ltd.
13 Pioneer Sector 1 Singapore 628424

751 465 6264 7001 | HP: +65 8506 6490 | =: 6264 7002

From: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg <rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 16 May 2023 1:58 pm

To: rasul@lkkauto.com

Subject: SMU4902G FINALISE

Without Prejudice,

Dear Rasul,

Please refer to attachments, kindly check & confirm finalize COR @ lumpsum $3,900.00 (before GST) & 6 repair days
(excluding PRS/RS/WEEKEND/PH).

Kindly check & revert ASAP.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Minoko Chan
R&S Autoclaim Pte. Ltd.
13 Pioneer Sector 1 Singapore 628424



75 +65 6264 7001 | HP: +65 8506 6490 | =: 6264 7002



