Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Sent: Wednesday, 17 May 2023 1:48 PM

To: Admin A; admin-d

Cc: '‘Ken Guan'; 'ARC Shujuan’; james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg
Subject: RE: RE: GBK3891T - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLW8930A

Hi,

The owner did not engage a lawyer & already sold the vehicle. Please cancel the claims.
Thanks for your attention.

Regards,

AR(

RAZALI

WhatApps: 91094915

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

Enterprise Hub 48 Toh Guan Road East #02-146/147 S608586
Tel: +65 6468 8834

Fax: +65 6722 8585

From: razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 2:27 PM

To: 'Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore)' <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ken Guan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'ARC Shujuan’ <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>;
'lames@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Subject: RE: RE: GBK3891T - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLW8930A

Dear Shanti,
Please refer attached as requested.
Thanks for your attention.

Regards,

AR(

RAZALI
WhatApps: 91094915
Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd



Enterprise Hub 48 Toh Guan Road East #02-146/147 S608586
Tel: +65 6468 8834
Fax: +65 6722 8585

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 12:27 PM

To: razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Cc: 'Ken Guan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'ARC Shujuan’ <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>;
james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: FW: RE: GBK3891T - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLW8930A

Internal
Dear Sir/Madam
Kindly provide us your client's GIA report and the LTA search.
Thank you.

Should you require any clarification or assistance, please do not hesitate to contact our Claims Department at
claims@allianz.com.sg

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

OQ | Allianz @ |

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

From: razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 3:25 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ken Guan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'ARC Shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>;
james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] RE: GBK3891T - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLW8930A

Hi,

Please advise liability status.



Thanks for your attention.

Regards,

AR(

RAZALI

WhatApps: 91094915

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

Enterprise Hub 48 Toh Guan Road East #02-146/147 S608586
Tel: +65 6468 8834

Fax: +65 6722 8585

From: razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 11:30 AM

To: 'claims@allianz.com.sg' <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: 'Ken Guan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'ARC Shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>;
'lames@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg' <james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Subject: GBK3891T - TP CLAIMS AGAINST SLW8930A

Dear Person in-charge,

Our client’s vehicle GBK3891T wants to make a third-party claim against SLW8930A which is insured by Allianz
Insurance.

Please find attached the GIA report, Insurer Enquiry & estimate.

Kindly let us know the Claim officer in charge of liability/settlement of our client’s claim.

The vehicle is currently not IN our workshop. Please arrange a survey after liability is cleared.

Thanks for your attention.

Best Regards,

AR(

RAZALI

WhatApps: 91094915

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

Enterprise Hub 48 Toh Guan Road East #02-146/147 S608586
Tel: +65 6468 8834

Fax: +65 6722 8585



