W

WEARNES

Our Reference: SFQ3110K/7022703 By Email / Mail
Your Reference: XE2628R

14/07/2023

Allianz Insurance Company of Singapore PTE LTD

Attn: Third Party Claim Department -

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR5212K/SHD3029H

Dear Officer,

We wish to inform you that the repairs to our client vehicle have been completed.

We hereby submit the claims as follows:

Details Remarks Amount (SGD)

Cost of Repairs 23603.35

Loss Of Rental 140.40 x 7 days 982.80

TOTAL 24586.15

Kindly let us have your offer to Andrewvickers@weames.com

Your soonest reply is much appreciated. Thank you.

Yours faithfully

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
Bodyshop and Paint Division
249 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159935

This is a computer generated printout, no signature is required.

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T 65 6430 4700 www.wearnesauto.com

Co reg no. 199501400R



(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
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WEARNES

SERVICE TAX INVOICE
0 - A00O0O04 SL: ALLIANZ INSURANCE COMPANY OF SINGAP

ALLIANZ INSURANCE COMPANY OF SINGAPORE PTE LTD

GST Reg.No:M28920628X

nmnwm ¢35} 421

79 ROBINSON ROAD Inv.No. . B&P 7022703 Page 1
#09-01 Inv.date. 10/07/2023
SINGAPORE 068897 WIP No. . : 17704
Veh.In/Out: 15/06/2023 22/06/2023
*Tel.No. : 65353585
Reg.No. . : SFQ3110K
Closed by .... : Juan Paulo Bongon Ba Reg.date .: 29/12/2015
Sve Consultant : ACC Mileage ..: 139,472
Remarks ...... : Mr CHIA SOON KIM RAY Chassis No: SALCA2AG8GH553551
Parts/Op.No Description Mech Qty Price Disc% Pkg Amount
802 TO REPLACE TAILGATE, RR BUMPER 0 2600.00 O 2,600.00
LOWER COVER, FOG LAMP LH
ETC
800 TO SPRAY TAILGATE, RR BUMPER, 0 2500.00 O 2,500.00
LOWER COVER
802 TO REMOVE & TRANSFER TAILGATE 0 500.00 O 500.00
INTERIOR COMPONENTS
802 TO REPLACE RR WINDSCREEN, ETC 0 1300.00 O 1,300.00
0080 TO INSTALL RR WINDSCREEN FILM 0 280.00 O 280.00
280 TO CHECK WIRING INCLUDE 0 621.00 O 621.00
RESETTING OF ALL ELECTRICAL
MODULES
802 TO REPAIR REAR END PANEL 0 1000.00 O 1,000.00
800 TO SPRAY REAR END PANEL 0 800.00 O 800.00
001161824 *D* PRIMER GLASS & P 1.0 EA 46.90 10 42.21
032132745 *D* WINDSCREEN SEALA 2.0 EA 192.90 10 347.22
LR0O75803 REAR WINDSCREEN DSPO 1.0 EA 1559.10 10 1,403.19

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T 6430 4700 www.wearnes.com

Co reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X
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WEARNES

SERVICE TAX INVOICE

ALLIANZ INSURANCE COMPANY OF SINGAPORE PTE LTD
79 ROBINSON ROAD

#09-01

SINGAPORE 068897

Closed by ....

Sve Consultant ; ACC

Remarks

s s 4 s

Juan Paulo Bongon Ba

: Mr CHIA SOON KIM RAY

SL: ALLIANZ INSURANCE COMPANY OF SINGAP

GST Reg.No:M28920628X

Inv.No. B&P 7022703 Page 2
Inv.date. 10/07/2023

WIP No. . : 17704

Veh.In/Out: 15/06/2023 22/06/2023
*Tel.No. : 65353585

Reg.No. . : SFQ3110K

Reg.date .: 29/12/2015

Mileage 139,472

Chassis No: SALCA2AG8GH553551

Mech Qty

LR061391
LR062123
LRO63644
LR0O63647
LR0O63663
LR088571
T4A16984
LR178744
LR102042
LR128147
LRO77792
LR137638
C286858

LR059784

Labour Total
Parts Total

TAILGATE PANEL DSPOR
BADGE OVAL REAR RR3
BADGE REAR "DISCO" D
BADGE REAR "VERY" DS
NAME PLATE - PLASTIC
LATCH - TAILGATE
CLIP

SEAL - TAILGATE

LAMP - FOG - REAR LH
BUMPER - REAR

BUMPER - COVER
REINFORCEMENT - BUMP
BUMPER NUT XF

SENSOR - PARKING AID

Package Total

GST: S=StdRated; O=0utOfScope;

9,601.00
12,253.95

= -
PR RRPRRRERORRPRRRPRRR

OO0 O0O0O0COO0O00O
=
>

Price Disc% Pkg Amount
3955.00 10 3,559.50
124.60 10 112.14
234.10 10 210.69
210.00 10 189.00
253.40 10 228.06
385.30 10 346.77
5.20 10 46.80
369.60 10 332.64
482.90 10 434.61
2377.90 10 2,140.11
841.70 10 757.53
1683.00 10 1,514.70
6.10 10 82.35
562.70 10 506.43
Gross Total 21,854.95
Netuaweasse o 21,854.95
GST @ 8.0% 1,748.40
Total....... 23,603.35
Paid........ 0.00
Please Pay.. 23,603.35

Z=ZeroRated; P=PreviousRate

Enquiries must be lodged within 14 days from the invoice date
This is a computer generated invoice. No signature is required.

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.
45 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159103 T 6430 4700 www.wearnes.com

Co reg no. 199501400R / GST reg no. M28920628X
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Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 July 2023 9:34 am

To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Cc: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: TP FINALIZED: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R

(Your Insured) DOA: 25/04/2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/AI1S23004439/ya3

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Hi Paulo,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $21,854.95 /- with 07 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Print only when necessary:

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>
Sent: Saturday, 8 July 2023 10:12 am
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: TP FINALIZED: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R (Your Insured) DOA: 25/04/2023
*** | KK REF: CC4/AIS23004439/ya3

Dear Rasul,
Kindly check & confirm finalized amount $21,854.95 before GST (part by part). 7 days repair.
Attached before paint & after repair photos.

Thank you

Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint



Juan Paulo Bom.;on Baldoz

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Sent: Saturday, 8 July 2023 10:12 am

To: ‘Rasul (LKKAuto)'

Subject: TP FINALIZED: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R (Your
Insured) DOA: 25/04/2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS23004439/ya3

Attachments: SFQ3110K FINALIZED TP (ALLIANZ).pdf; B (1).jpeg; B (2).jpeg; B (3).jpeg; B (4).jpeg; B

(5)jpeg; B (6).jpeg; B (7).jpeg; B (8).jpeg; S (1).jpeg; S (2).jpeg; S (3).jpeg; S (4).jpeg; S
(5)Jpeg:; S (6).jpeg; S (7).jpeg; S (8).jpeg: A (1).jpeg; A (2).jpeg; A (3).jpeg; A (4) jpeg; A
(5)Jpeg; A (6).jpeg; A (7).jpeg; A (8).jpeg; A (9)jpeg; A (10).jpeg

Importance: High
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Dear Rasul,

Kindly check & confirm finalized amount $21,854.95 before GST (part by part). 7 days repair.
Attached before paint & after repair photos.

Thank you

Paulo
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

V 45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 98270463
WEARNES WwWww.wearnesauto.com  juan.paulo@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Sent: Tuesday, 20 June 2023 11:34 am

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SUPPLEMENTARY: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R (Your Insured) DOA:

25/04/2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/A1523004439/ya3
Importance: High

Hi Rasul,

Refer to attached supplementary list & photos.

REAR END PANEL — REPAIR & SPRAY required.

Thank you



N

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

Co Reg No. 199501400R / GST Reg Na. M28920628X
45 Leng Kee Road. Singapore 159103

WEARNES

Telephone: +65 6876 5063
www.wearnesleasing.com

Tax Invoice

ALLIANZ INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Inv No. : R2300475
#09-01 Ref :
Terms : COD

Singapore 068897

Rental Information

Agreement No. : RA23/00243
Billing Period : 15/06/2023 10:00 - 21/06/2023 18:00
Driver Name : Chia Soon Kim Raymond

Model

(far Information

: Registration No. : SFP3993]
Make

: TOYOTA
: LEXUS RX300 5DR SUvV
(AT) (2WD) EXECUTIVE

Unit

# Description Qty UOM Price Amt
1 Being Rental Payment for the Period Stated Above 7.00 Day 130.00 910.00
Remarks:
SFQ3110K_Allianz {LR)_Paulo
Payment method: Subtotal : S$ 910.00
Interbank GIRO and credit card payments: Deduction will take place from Sth GST 8.0% : S$ 72.80
to 9th of the month. Total : 5$ 982.80

Cheque payments: All cheques should be crossed and made payable to
“Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd".

Bank Transfers:

Oversea-Chinese Banking Corporation Limited
Bank Code: 7339

Branch Code: 501

Bank Account Name:
Bank Account:
SWIFT CODE:

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
501-296727-001
OCBCSGSG

Please note that late payment interest will be imposed at a rate of 2% per
month commencing from the date that the payment is due, compounded
daily, plus an administrative fee of 5$50.00 (excluding GST) each time.

This is a computer generated document, No signature is required.

FAGE1OF 1




Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 11:37 am

To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R (Your Insured)

DOA: 25/04/2023 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIS23004439/ya3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING XE2628R AND SFQ3110K ON 25.04.2023
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of
the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of
repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

With warmest regards,
Ezlyna
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 9, 2023 8:59 AM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Motor Claims {(Allianz Insurance
Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement involving vehicle SFQ3110K (Ours) & XE2628R (Your Insured) DOA: 25/04/2023 *** LKK
REF: CC4/AIS23004439/ya3

Importance: High

2"° REMINDER!

Dear Lyna,

Kindly check if your insured lodge their accident report & advise the liability.

Revert to us as soon as possible.

Thank you



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

I, CRAL Sou ey _\1__M F"i?{”thc third party claimant™)
of o WOUGMET AVER NS X - 73

owner  of X &Q P\ k _ (vehicle no) hereby authorize
WEARMNBL AUTHNMY TWe Pre YD

~ (address),

(““the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and / or rental

1O
and / or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. STR32 < ~ that ‘was

damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 5 l “t\ . (date) along
N2 AAW TOXAS codTy FUanceE A

— o _ (location)
involving vehicle no XE 26 2%y

(“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to sign the discharge voucher on my behalf to setile
my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further
authorized 1o receive payment further to settlement of my claim with payment

cheque/s being made in Zavour of the workshop. als

[ further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on
a without prejudize and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver /

owner / insurers of the other vehicle/s is concemed. =

Dated this  #~ @ dayof S (month)2073  (year)

2

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop”
Policyholder’s Signature only
& Company Chop — (if registered under s company)



$003234Q0001 / OPTIMA WERKZ PTE LTD
ENTRY CATE & TIME: 26/04/2023 14:27 (SGT)
SUBMITTED BY: MOHAMED NASHIK
VERSION: 1 (26/04/2023 14:27 (SGT))

MUAPSZ

o
€ SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report carrectly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate

policy liability.

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving
and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made available aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date of Submission

Reported by

Date of Accident

Exact Location of Accident
Additional Location Information
Country/State of Loss

26/04/2023 14:27 (SGT)

Both Policyholder and Actual Driver

25/04/2023 17:45 (SGT)

Near 49H Tuas South Ave 1, Singapore 637258
TUAS SOUTH AVE 3, SINGAPORE

Singapore

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
INSURED/POLICYHOLDER

Is company?

Name Of Registered Owner
NRIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No

VEHICLE PARTICULARS

Manufacturer
Model
Variant

Exact purpose for which vehicle was being used at time of
accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy for repair to
your vehicle?

Vehicle Category

Transmission

CcC

INSURANCE COMPANY

Name of Insurance Company
Policy Number / Cover Note Number

DRIVER

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

@) Accident report S003234Q0001

SFQ3110K

No

CHIA SOON KIM RAYMOND
S6805459A
RAYCSK@GMAIL.COM
(Phone) +65-96834676

LandRover
Discovery

@gx-;)

Private use

No - Claiming third party
Private car

Auto

1999

Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
MT/00991098/01

CHIA SOON KIM RAYMOND
S6805459A

31/01/1968

Indoor

Page 1 0of 16
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Date Of Driving Pass 09/10/1396/

Driving experience 35 YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
Gender Male

Mobile Number (Phone) +65-96834676
Alt. Phone Number -

Email Address RAYCSK@GMAIL.COM
Address 76 HOUGANG AVENUE 7
Address complement #09-23

Postcode $538807

Is the driver the policyholder? Yes

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured -

Does Driver Own Other Vehicles? No

Vehicle Registration Number of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver

Insurance Company of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver -

GENERAL INFORMATION OF THE ACCIDENT

Type of Accident Collision - Head to Rear
Weather Conditions Clear
Road Surface Dry

OTHER INFORMATION

Was any foreign vehicle involved in the accident? No
Number of vehicles involved in the accident 2
Was anybody injured in the Accident? No
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by ambulance? -
Was any other vehicle or property damaged? Yes
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Has the driver been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance? ‘No

Translator's name -
Translator's ID -
Translator's phone number =
Translator's email -
Original language used in the statement =

DETAILS OF POLICE ACTION
Was the accident reported to the police? No
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? No

If yes, against whom? %

CIRCUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT

REFER TO SKETCH PLAN

ATTACHMENT(S)

Are accident photos available for attachment? Yes
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? No
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number XE2628R
Vehicle Manufacturer Scania
Vehicle Model -

Vehicle Variant -
Vehicle Colour -

Vehicle Category Commercial vehicle
Name of Driver TOH KAM SING
Passport No/FIN G7542240M

@)Accident report S003234Q0001 Page 2 of 16



Contact Number {Fnhoneg) *bo-344b0oUbY
Address =

Address complement -
Postcode >
Insurance Company Name B
Nature Of Damage “
Details of property damaged in accident -
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver) -

@& Accident report S003234Q0001 Page 3 of 16



SKETCH PLAN

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Aease report corractly the detalls of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Formmust be completed by the Policyholdor and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. hformation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible, Any wilful misrepresentation or withholding of material facts may
akow insurance companies o repudiate policy liabllity.

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is nol an admission of pocy liabdity on Lhe part of the insurance
cempanios. )

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Polico for investination.

6. The repont w Ml be forw arded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the Genora! Insurance Assoctation
of Singapore (GlA) fer archiving and that copies of this report will for a feoc be made avadable upon apphcation by interested perlies.

7. By the lodgement of this report 1o lhe insurers, you hereby consent o the archiving of this report al the centre and 1o copies of the
roport being made available aforesald.

8. Consent under the Personal Bata Protection Act (POPA)

lunderstand, acknow ledge, agree and censent that :

{a) My insurer , my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ("GIA"} may/arc permilted lo collect, use, disclose
andior process my personal data/personal infermation sel oul in Lhis [ferm) and any other personal information provided by me or
possaossed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information™) and disclose and transfer such Parsonal nformation {o all insurer(s)
w ho have insured vehicle(s) involved in Lhis accident (all insurer(s) w ho have insured vehicke(s) involved in this accident shall be
collectively referred to as the “Insurars”), the nsurers’ law yers/law firms, tho Menetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant
gavernmeni agency/authority (such as the pelice). fer the purpose(s) of :

(i) precessing, handfng andfor dealing with my clains including the setlement of the claims and any necassary ewesligalions relating lo
the claims;

{i9) investigating the accident and/or my claurs;
{i3) carrying out and/or deakng w ith myy instructions or responding 1o any enquities by mo,
(iv) administering my claims {includirg the mailing of carrespondence, statements, inveices, reports or notices to me, w hich coukd involve

disclosure of certain perscnal data aboul ma to bring aboul defivery of the sama as w el as an the external cover of anvelepas/mail
packages), andfor

{v) canplying with applicable law in administering. processing, handiing andfor deatng with my claims.
{collectively the "Purposes”)

(b) aitinsurer(s) w ho have insured vehiclo{s) involved in 1his accident and the hsurers’ law yers/law firms, may/fare permitted to collect,
use, disclese andfer process my Personal hformation for one or more of the above Purpases; and

{c) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers andfor GIA to their third party service providers or agents
{including their w yarsilaw (Irms), which may be sited oulside of Singapare, for one cr more of the above Purposes.

Y %
&

Folicyholder's Signature I Daté Driver's Signalare (B driver is not the pofcyholder) / Date Wilnessed by Reporting Cenire
Time & Time Personnel NAS e

Sketch Plan

KRR
]
[ i
| | @T’x gkqgf-_rck
i I @'—‘M?ézeﬁ
| g
3 CEoE
0

45 Soath Ave 2

@ Accident report S003234Q0001 Page 4 of 16



SKETCH PLAN #2

Describe Circumstances of the Accident

O 25 Aofit 2023 47 Apec? S: 4S8 P Z woAS @nl LAJE
TYRSE Syt AvEdUES

~r

2 2B, NG CHR LOIAS STATIONARY RABoUT 20m@ra [Flovn THE TZAFF/C

TanCTION . THE 2:6#7S  (WOeee feb., Swoesenits 7 neAaes A

CLASHIE  ANE 1Y CAR  LUR =D FORWALD, L ymmEeENATELy

LEDEED A7 7oE Lrae  ViGud siifRIC HND  ShAn> FBTHAZ P oi7E

M) B LAD  LEAR  ENOEA iy AL . THE VOolGE AT MY wlE

wohc XE 2623R,

Declaration

WWe declare the faregaing particulars are true n every respect.

= b o

Policyholder's Signature / Date'& Driver's Signature (¥ crwver is riol the policyhokler} / Date Wiinessed by Raporling Centre
Timg & T Parsonnel MLl ik

@)Accident report SO03234Q0001 Page 5 of 16
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