Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:

Dear Darren,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Adrian / Sur,

FYNA. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

Monday, 10 July 2023 10:03 AM

Darren Ng; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)
Admin A; SUR; assignments

RE: CONFIRM FINALIZE FOR SME8407C

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Saturday, July 8, 2023 10:33 AM
To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto)

<adrianling@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: CONFIRM FINALIZE FOR SME8407C

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir & LKK,

As per above mentioned vehicle.

We confirmed finalize amount at $8900 and 6 Days

Regards
Darren
68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK

UBI AVE 1 #01-24
S(408934)



