Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 April 2023 10:40 am

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Justin Wong; Don Bong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10021908 /KY || Ol- SGT1486L (Grey) TP-SNJ3314G || Est: $0.00 || JEC Auto Svc PL
Attachments: C10021908 - TP (SNJ3314G).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SNJ3314G. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

Ah Xiamn
92327457
1 Kaki Bukit Awvenue

#0Z2-11 Auitobay

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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From: autoservice Jec <jecautoservice@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 9:34 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request on 28.04.2023 | | C10021908/KY - Your Ref: SNJ3314G

Dear Frauleine,
Thanks for your prompt response.
We would like to opt for LKK to surveyor the vehicle.

Thank you for your arrangement and have a great day ahead :)



Best Regards,

Ah Xian

92327457

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-11 Autobay

5417883

From: autoservice Jec <jecautoservice@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 6:03 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: SNJ3314G

Hi Team,

Please assist to arrange surveyor to survey the vehicle.

Vehicle at workshop currently.

Kindly assist to check the liability if we can do direct settlement for this case?



We look forward to hearing from you soon.

Thanks!

Best Regards,

Ah Xian

92327457

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6
#02-11 Autobay

5417883



