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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 July 2023 9:06 AM
To: Boo seng yak; Carrine Leong; Chang Chee Sing; jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg
Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: FINAL REVISION - SNA7786Z - OD AIG - SURVEYED 20 APR 23

Hi Mr Boo,  
  
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $20,629.80 /- with 12 days of 

repair before GST, subject to their approval. 
 

 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Boo seng yak <boojohnny@gmail.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 19 July 2023 4:29 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 
Carrine Leong <carrine.leong@premiumauto.com.sg>; Chang Chee Sing <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; 
jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg <jiayee.yap@premiumauto.com.sg> 
Subject: FINAL REVISION - SNA7786Z - OD AIG - SURVEYED 20 APR 23  
  
Hi Rasul and all,  
 
Revised estimate, photographs attached. 
 
Pls confirm repair cost of $20,629.80 @ 12 days exclude 2 Sundays. 
 
Your early closure is appreciated. 
 
 
Best regards - Johnny Boo 


