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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Ashlene Lee Bee Gan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) 
<BeeGan.Lee@stridespremier.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 22 June 2023 10:34 AM
To: Admin A; CS A Team
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: LOD  - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB912M & SJK6633H ON 20/04/2023 ALONG BUKIT 

TIMAH ROAD
Attachments: CLAIMS LAID UP REPORT.pdf; GEARS.pdf; INVOICE.pdf; RENTAL PROOF.pdf; SAS.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Our Ref: TAX/04/23/2045/AL 
 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We claim on behalf of STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SHB912M. Your driver’s negligent driving has 
caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:- 
 

Cost of Repair $2,950.00            

Loss of Rental $490.56  ( 6 days x $81.76  ) 

Loss of Income $360.00  ( 6 days x $60.00  ) 

Gears search fee $2.00            

Total $3,802.56            
 
We enclose the following documents:  

1)    Repair Invoice  
2)    Proof of Rental Rate 
3)    SAS report  
4)    Gears Search 
5)    Laid up report 

 
We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. 
Kindly issue payment in favour to STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD. 
 
 
Regards, 

ashlene 

Ashlene Lee 
Claim Department 
  
Strides AutomoƟve Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705 
DID: 6866 2615 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: BeeGan.Lee@stridespremier.com.sg  | www.stridesmobility.com.sg 
hƩps://www.smrt.com.sg/Compliment 
  







  

 
 
 
  
 
Our Ref : TAX/04/23/2045/AL 

 
Date : 20/04/2023 
 
To  : Claims Department 
 
From : Strides Taxi Pte Ltd 

 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB912M & SJK6633H ON 20/04/2023 ALONG BUKIT 
TIMAH ROAD 
 
CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL 
 
This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHB912M is 
$81.76/day. 
 
Kindly proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this 
accident.  
 
 

 
 
 


