Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 April 2023 9:37 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A; assignments

Subject: RE: Request TP Claim Survey for GBJ1201D accident on 09/04/2023 claiming against
PC3151Y

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 5:36 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Request TP Claim Survey for GBJ1201D accident on 09/04/2023 claiming against PC3151Y

Internal

Your ref: GBJ1201D
Our ref: 2023 32007135FR-PC3151Y

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Selamatshahh Zainal ETHOZ
HP: 9624 8656
DID: 6654 7519

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R
Claims Service



Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897
Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg
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This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

&2 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Selamatshahh Zainal <Selamatshahh.Zainal@ethozprotect.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 19, 2023 10:23 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Jackson Teo Ban Chye <jackson.teo@ethozprotect.com>

Subject: [EXT] Request TP Claim Survey for GBJ1201D accident on 09/04/2023 claiming against PC3151Y

Dear Motor Claims,

Please assist to make arrangement for TP survey GBJ1201D accident on 09/04/2023. Claiming against your insured
PC3151Y. A copy of the accident report and estimate is enclosed. Vehicle can be survey at Ethoz 30 Bukit Batok
Crescent.

Before we proceed to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this
notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you
within the stipulated timeline, we shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Warmest Regards,
Selamatshahh Zainal

DID: 6654 7519
Fax: 6654 7543

Disclaimer: This message may contain confidential information intended only for the use of the addressee named
above. If you are not the intended recipient of this message you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or reproduction of this message is prohibited. If you received this message by mistake, please notify the
sender by reply email immediately. Please conduct your own virus checks before opening any attachment as ETHOZ
PROTECT does not guarantee the integrity of this email or attached files has been maintained nor this communication is
free of viruses, interceptions or interference. Any views expressed in this message are those of the individual sender
and may not necessarily reflect the views of ETHOZ PROTECT. ETHOZ PROTECT shall not be responsible nor liable for the
improper and incomplete transmission of the information contained in this communication nor for any delay in its
receipt or damage to your system.



