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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 5:53 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: Henry Lee (Ding Auto); Kenneth Ding; Celine Chua (Ding Auto); SUR
Subject: Re: RE : AIS I OD CLAIM - SJS9919Y I REF : 2023322007458 - FINALIZE REPAIR

Dear Veron, 
 
We are agreeable to your offer. 
Kindly assist us to upload your offer in Merimen before we can proceed to issue DV & tax invoice to the 
respective insurance company, thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented 
automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

  

Lynn Yap  
Claims Department 

 
Mobile +65 9385 8368  Office +65 6452 1208  
Web www.dingauto.sg  Email claims@dingauto.sg  
HQ  176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721  
Branch  Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 
  

 
 
On Tue, May 9, 2023 at 5:20 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Henry, 

  

  

“Without Prejudice” 

  

COR $5,975.50 before excess $600 

  

Will offer in merimen shortly.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Henry Lee (Ding Auto) <sa0406@dingauto.sg>  
Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 4:09 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Lynn Yap (Ding Auto) <Claims@dingauto.sg>; Celine Chua (Ding 
Auto) <accounts@dingauto.sg> 
Subject: RE : AIS I OD CLAIM - SJS9919Y I REF : 2023322007458 - FINALIZE REPAIR 

  

Dear Veron, 

  

Good day to you. 

  

Kindly refer to the attached before/after paint photos for your 
review      

and approval.  

  

We would like to finalise P/P repair as below : 

  

Parts - $4405.50 

S/N - $120.00 

Labour - $1570.00 
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Total : $6095.50. 

  

Repair - 05 days. 

  

Kindly assist us to expedite this finalization asap. Hope to hear  

from you soon. Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented 
automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

Henry Lee  
Claims Department 

 
Mobile +65 8363 6141  |  Office +65 6452 1208  
Web www.dingauto.sg  |  Email sa0406@dingauto.sg  
HQ  176 Sin Ming Drive #04-06 Sin Ming Autocare S575721  
Branch  Blk 10 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C #01-20 S575645 

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.
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