Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 April 2023 9:34 AM
To: HanZC

Cc: SUR; Gary Seah

Subject: RE: Allianz OD SMX7101R
Attachments: SMX7101R revise Estimate.pdf
Dear Han,

Please proceed the check items as marking by our surveyor as attached and take note that the repair cost at $8,884.61 on part by part basis. (excess $700/-)

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: HanZC <hanzc@smemotor.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 26, 2023 2:20 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Gary Seah <gary.seah@smemotor.com.sg>
Subject: Allianz OD SMX7101R

Dear Huey Yon,

Your surveyor has conducted the physical re-inspection on the check items that are damaged after dismantle, attached the Marked Estimate.
Kindly assist to revert to the insurance and update us once approval is given.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Han ZC

SME MOTOR PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk D, #02-15/16/17/18
AutoBay @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 6106 (6 lines)
Fax: 6744 2368



