Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 2 May 2023 9:08 AM

To: Jenny Lim

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: AIS-OD / SDG 6462B- DOA: 13/04/2023

Dear Jenny,
Re-send.

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDG 6462B at repair cost $35,947.20
on part by part basis (Excess $0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Please provides parts invoice upon finalize

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@Iaihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 28, 2023 4:55 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS-OD / SDG 6462B- DOA: 13/04/2023

Dear Huey Yon

We are unable to undertake the repair at the amount of $32,353.00 (exclude check items) and total estimate less 10%.
Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267



From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 24 April 2023 11:01 am

To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS-OD / SDG 6462B- DOA: 13/04/2023

Dear Jenny,
Kindly check with your workshop whether able to repair the vehicle not more than $32,353.00 exclude check items.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@Iaihuat.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 21, 2023 3:10 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AIS-OD / SDG 6462B- DOA: 13/04/2023

Dear Huey Yon

A copy of the amended estimate is enclosed for your reference.
Thank you.

Kind regards.

Jenny Lim

for LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD
160 Sin Ming Drive

#04-01, #04-02 & #07-03

Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 64538110

Fax: 64596267

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 20 April 2023 4:08 pm

To: Jenny Lim <jenny.lim@laihuat.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: AIS-OD / SDG 6462B- DOA: 13/04/2023

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Refer to the tele-conversation between you and Shiau Chan.

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SDG 6462B at repair cost up to
$25,000.00 on part by part basis (Excess $0/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434
to arrange our surveyor for inspection.



All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights_not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




