Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 May 2023 3:46 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive); Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; CS A Team
Subject: Re: Finalization for PD1018H

Hi Veron,

Ok. Please proceed

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road
(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, May 17, 2023 at 1:00 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Lau,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $12,490 (before excess $4500) with 12 days of repair, subject
to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 16, 2023 3:38 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>




Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PD1018H

Hi Veron,

We refer to the email below.

Please advise why they offer Lump sum? This bus is only less than 2months.

This case should be part by part.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136

Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Tue, May 16, 2023 at 3:34 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Lau,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $10,000 (before excess $4500) with 12 days of repair,
subject to their approval.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, May 15, 2023 11:20 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive)
<connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PD1018H

Hi Veron

We refer to the email below,

Please advise on the finalised amount?

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697



On Thu, May 11, 2023 at 10:02 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Veron

We refer to the email below,

Please advise on the finalised amount?

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Tue, May 9, 2023 at 9:35 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Veron

We refer to the email below,

Please advise on the finalised amount?

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road



(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Thu, May 4, 2023 at 2:17 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Veron

We refer to the email below,

Please advise on the finalised amount?

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, May 3, 2023 at 11:26 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Veron

We refer to the email below,

Please advise on the finalised amount?

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136



Connect 3
566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, May 3, 2023 at 10:53 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Ms Lau,

Attach mark estimate

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 3, 2023 9:12 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Finalization for PD1018H

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 May 2023 9:11:59 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
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To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive)
<connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PD1018H

Hi Taufikh,

Please let us have the marked estimate.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Fri, Apr 28, 2023 at 9:59 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

We refer to the above matter.

Please let us have the marked estimate.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697



On Thu, Apr 27, 2023 at 1:53 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

We refer to the above matter.

Please let us have the marked estimate.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, Apr 26, 2023 at 1:19 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Taufikh,

We refer to the above matter.

Please let us have the marked estimate.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road



(Mandai Estate) S 728697



