Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Darren Ng <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 10:52 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: MSIG-TP SML 5915K DOA: 16/04/2023

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,

We agreed with the proposed amount.

Kindly submit your report and we will send LOD over.

Regards

Darren

68442475

BLK 53 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
UBI AVE 1 #01-24

S(408934)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2023 10:20 am

To: Darren

Cc: SUR

Subject: MSIG-TP SML 5915K DOA: 16/04/2023

Dear Darren,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
As spoken with you.

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $2,500/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



