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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 18 April 2023 4:27 PM
To: 'S Three Automotive'; Meng Yan (LKK Auto); SUR
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: YP6878P - OWN DAMAGE CLAIM-DOA: 10/4/2023

Dear Joey, 
 
 
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YP 6878P. Lump Sum Not 
Exceeding $25,000/- or whichever lower. (Excess $3000/-). 
 
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspecƟon.  
 
All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 
before compleƟon of the repair. 
 
*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, April 18, 2023 10:53 AM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YP6878P - OWN DAMAGE CLAIM-DOA: 10/4/2023 
 
Dear Veron 
 
Kindly assist to get insurance approval. 
 
Thank You 
 
With Best Regards 
 
Joey Kho 
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S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate 
#01-64/66 Singapore – 575643 
Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575 
Fax: 65-6487 5315 
Email: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg 
FaceBook: https://m.facebook.com/starcarleasingPL 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 18 April 2023 10:36 AM 
To: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YP6878P - OWN DAMAGE CLAIM-DOA: 10/4/2023 
 
Dear Joey, 
 
As spoken. 
 
Kindly check vehicle able to repair at Lump Sum Not Exceeding $25,000/- or whichever lower (subject to 
insurance approval). 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, April 17, 2023 11:10 AM 
To: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: YP6878P - OWN DAMAGE CLAIM 
 
Dear Joey, 
 
Noted, we will arrange survey today. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698  | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: S Three Automotive <admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 2:54 PM 
To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: YP6878P - OWN DAMAGE CLAIM 
 
Dear officer in charge 
 
Kindly arrange surveyor to survey vehicle at my workshop. 
 
Thank You 
 
With Best Regards 
 
Joey Kho 

 
S Three Automotive Recovery Pte Ltd 
Blk 8 Sin Ming Industrial Estate 
#01-64/66 Singapore – 575643 
Tel: 65-6284 1542 / 65-6284 1575 
Fax: 65-6487 5315 
Email: admin@sthreeautomotive.com.sg 
FaceBook: https://m.facebook.com/starcarleasingPL 
 


