Nivitha

From: Nivitha

Sent: Monday, 17 April 2023 8:00 AM
To: Swee Leong Eggs Distributor
Subject: GIA REPORT for GBE3559K
Attachments: GBE3559K_13042023.pdf

Hi, attached is the GIA REPORT for GBE3559K.
Thank you.

Best Regards

G.Nivitha

Phone- 6841 0055 / 6741 3583

Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 Paya, Ubi Industrial Park, 408933

From: Swee Leong Eggs Distributor <sweeleongeggs@yahoo.com>
Sent: Saturday, April 15,2023 11:12 AM

To: Nivitha <nivitha@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBF4557D

This is vehicle GBE3559K certificate of insurance.

Best Regards,

John Poh

Swee Leong Eggs Distributor
221 Jalan Kayu

Singapore 799445

Tel: (+65) 6482-0837 / 6483-3203
Fax: (+65) 6483-4948

On Friday, 14 April 2023 at 05:40:38 pm SGT, Nivitha <nivitha@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi, please be informed that the vehicle which was towed yesterday was GBE3559K. but the driver came and reported
today was for GBF 4557D. It was reported wrongly, | guess. | am unable to submit the report due to the information
provided was incorrect.

Kindly revert.

Thank you.

Best Regards



G.Nivitha
Phone- 6841 0055 / 6741 3583

Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 Paya, Ubi Industrial Park, 408933

From: Nivitha

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 5:10 PM
To: sweeleongeggs@yahoo.com
Subject: GBF4557D

Hi, just now your driver Mr. Khor Cha Hock came to do the accident reporting for GBF4557D but there seems to be a
misunderstanding and | just got to know the accident vehicle which is GBF4557D was not present. There was a vehicle
yesterday that was towed is yesterday, but it was not your vehicle. | need GBF4557D to be here for me to take the picture
and send to the insurance for the accident report submission.

Or else | am unable to submit the report today.

| have been calling your boss -9368 6878 and the driver -91776660 but they are not picking up.

Kindly assist

Thank you.

Best Regards

G.Nivitha

Phone- 6841 0055 / 6741 3583

Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 Paya, Ubi Industrial Park, 408933



