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Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 14 April 2023 11:55 am
To: admin-d; SUR; assignments
Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Ng Chen How
Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10021586/CH || OI- SBW6848L (Blue) TP-GW3675D || Est: $0.00 || Yew Hok Auto Services
Attachments: C10021586 - TP (GW3675D).zip

Hi Team,  
 
We would like to request TP PRS for GW3675D.  TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle. 
 
Workshop information:  
Address:        

 
 
Please confirm assignment.   
 
Thank you. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
Frauleine Khoo 
Admin Executive, Claims 
 
 
T +65 6989 3696 
F +65 6725 0853   
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg 
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111 
Claims +65 6221 2199 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance. 
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended 
addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto 
& General. This email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and 
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.  

 
 
 

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 11:41 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: TPPD PRS on 14.04.2023 // OUR REF: L23.0334.cj // YR REF: C10021586/CH - SBW 6848L // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 3675D AND SBW 6848L ON 
08.04.2023 
 
Dear Sirs 
 
We refer to your email of same date. 
  
Our client is agreeable to the following surveyor(s) as the SJE: LKK 
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Please arrange for your surveyor to survey our client’s vehicle at the following address:    

YEW HOK AUTO SERVICES 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #02-11 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: Ah Hok / 82857623 
 
Please instruct your surveyor to conduct the pre-repair survey immediately and complete the pre-repair survey within 2 working days of his 
appointment. 
  
Kindly let us have the pre-repair and/or post repair survey report upon completion of the survey(s). 
  
As solicitors on record, our client shall look to you for payment of our legal costs plus disbursements should you reach a direct settlement with our 
client’s repairer.  
  
Regards 
Irene 
Kuru & Co  
150 South Bridge Road 
#04-06 Fook Hai Building 
Singapore 058727 
Tel: 6532 2009  
Fax: 6532 2007 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information and/or may be subjected to legal 
privilege. If you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information 
contained herein.   
 
 

  

From: Kuru & Co <kurulegal@yahoo.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 11:22 AM 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Julie Mangubat <julie.m@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: PRE-REPAIR SURVEY // OUR REF: L23.0334.cj // YR REF: SBW 6848L // ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 3675D AND SBW 6848L ON 08.04.2023 
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Dear Sirs, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GW 3675D AND SBW 6848L ON 08.04.2023 

AT/ALONG JUNCTION OF ANG MO KIO AVENUE 5 

NOTIFICATION OF ACCIDENT AND PRE-REPAIR SURVEY 

  

We act for Welcom Motor Agencies, whose vehicle registration number GW 3675D was damaged in the above accident. 

  

A copy of our client’s Singapore Accident Statement is enclosed. 

Before our client proceeds with repairs, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you would like to conduct a 
pre-repair survey. 

If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed with repairs without further reference to you. 

  

Regards 

Irene 

Kuru & Co  
150 South Bridge Road 
#04-06 Fook Hai Building 
Singapore 058727 
Tel: 6532 2009  

Fax: 6532 2007 
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CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended for the addressee(s) only and may contain confidential information and/or may be subjected to legal privilege. If 
you have received in error,  please notify us immediately by return email, delete this message and you shall not disseminate, distribute or copy any information contained 
herein.   


