Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 22 June 2023 12:05 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SMJ4888Y
Hi Veron,

confirmed as below.
Thank you.

Rgds
Efeeda
Cheng Hoe Motor PL

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, June 19, 2023 9:25 AM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) ; SUR

Subject: RE: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SM14888Y

Dear Efeeda,

Surveyor’s have review again.

Labour for panel beating -$500
Spray painting- $600

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $3,789.20 (before excess $600) with 4 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Sunday, June 18, 2023 11:19 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SMJ4888Y

Hi Veron,

Please consider labour for panel beating and spray painting at S600 respectively as support top panel
replaced.



Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL
Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, June 17, 2023 10:06 PM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) ; SUR

Subject: RE: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SM14888Y

Dear Efeeda,

Any update.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 5:08 PM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SMJ4888Y

Dear Efeeda,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of $3,689.20 (before excess $600) with 4 days of repair,
subject to their approval.

Panel beating-$500
Spray paint-$500

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, June 15, 2023 10:27 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST - SMJ4888Y

Hi Veron,

Finalization and photos as attached.

Pls let us have your confirmation on the COR $3889.20 via reply email.

Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL
Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Sunday, May 28, 2023 10:09 AM

To: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe -Yishun)

Subject: PENDING FOR FINAIZE REPAIR COST

Dear Efeeda,
Kindly advised vehicle status.

If vehicle repaired done, kindly send us finalize.

Reference Vehicle No Type Accident Date

S$6: Desktop Survey

CS6/AIS23003873/Hvp3 SMJ 4888Y OD2 11/04/2023

Survey (OD.TP)

CS/SM022005696/Kvy3 GBE 5390R oD 13/06/2022

CS/CTI22012759/Kvy3 SLR 4088J TP 13/12/2022

CS/CTI23001414/Kvp3 GBE 1520J oD 01/02/2023

CS/CTI23001635/Kvp3 GBE 9009S TP 07/02/2023

CS/CTI23003491/Kvp3 GBD 9530H TP 06/03/2023

CS/MSG23002370/Kvy3 SKZ 4498D TP 03/03/2023
CHENG HOE MOTOR (AMK)

Reference Vehicle No Type Accident Date

S$6: Desktop Survey

CS6/AIS22012348/Cvp3 SMN 2559P OD2 03/12/2022

Survey (OD,TP)




CS/MSG22010923/Kvy3 SMH 6787 TP

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

28/10/2022



