Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 July 2023 4:06 PM
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLV 1467Y

From: AF & CARS <enquiry@afcars.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 July 2023 4:05:14 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLV 1467Y

Dear Sir/Madam,
Ok noted with thanks, please proceed.

On Wed, Jul 26, 2023 at 9:16 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi,

I've already negotiate with your mechanic, that's the best offer that | can made.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: AF & CARS <enquiry@afcars.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 25 July 2023 1:13 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLV 1467Y

Dear Sir/Madam,
Able to quote the lump sum higher?

On Tue, Jul 25, 2023 at 8:56 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com> wrote:
Hi ,

refer to attachment

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $1,200.00 /- with 02 days of repair
before GST, subject to their approval.



Kindly acknowledge and email me the after repair photos

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

Best Regards

AF & CARS PTE LTD

48 Toh Guan Road East
#01-141

Enterprise Hub
Singapore 608586

Contact: +65 8611 8181
Servicing Appointment Contact: +65 8181 3556

Best Regards

AF & CARS PTE LTD

48 Toh Guan Road East
#01-141

Enterprise Hub
Singapore 608586

Contact: +65 8611 8181
Servicing Appointment Contact: +65 8181 3556



