Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 April 2023 3:06 PM
To: Marvyn Chua; SUR

Cc: Autolnsure

Subject: RE: GBC9596Z (OD)_30/03/2023

Dear Marvyn,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBC 9596Z at repair cost not more than $14,000/- on Lump Sum basis or whichever lower (Excess
$5,000/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.
All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Marvyn Chua <Marvyn.Chua@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, April 12, 2023 2:57 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: RE: GBC9596Z (OD)_30/03/2023

Dear Shiau Chan,
We refer to the above matter and email below.

We seek your authorization to increase the repair limit to $15,000.00 (before GST) on a lump sum basis for this claim.
Thank You.

Regards
Marvyn

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363
e: marvyn.chua@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
192800002R
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 April 2023 4:36 pm

To: Marvyn Chua <Marvyn.Chua@autoinsure.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBC9596Z (OD)_30/03/2023

Dear Marvyn,

Kindly check whether your workshop able to repair the vehicle GBC 95967 at repair cost not more than $13,000.00 on Lump Sum basis.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 4:40 PM

To: Marvyn Chua <Marvyn.Chua@autoinsure.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBC9596Z (OD)_30/03/2023

Dear Marvyn,

Noted with thanks.



Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Marvyn Chua <Marvyn.Chua@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 4:20 PM

To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBC9596Z (OD)_30/03/2023

Dear Rajes,

We refer to the above matter and email below.

We have confirmation from the owner to be leaving his vehicle on our premises tomorrow (11/4/23) at 9.30AM.
Please arrange for PRS tomorrow.

Thank You.

Regards
Marvyn

did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628
mobile: (65) 9743 6363
e: marvyn.chua@autoinsure.com.sg

Auto Insure Pte. Ltd.
192800002R
6 Marsiling Lane S739145

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 April 2023 4:05 pm

To: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; assighments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: GBC9596Z (OD) 30/03/2023

Dear Mavin,

As spoken, please let us know in advance if any arrangement for this vehicle GBC9596Z.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



