Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, April 14, 2023 10:31 AM

To: Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OD Claim for Vehicle YN 7194H - DOA 25/03/2023 - MFC REF:
D23001166MFCV/PTE/OD

Dear Xin Yu,

Kindly inform repairer to proceed with repair.

Please note take:
1. The repair cost should not be more than $9,000.00.
2. Thereis an excess of $750.00 applicable.

Thank you.

Chris Lim
Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd
16 Raffles Quay

#42-01 Hong Leong Building
Singapore 048581

D: 6507 3853 | M: 6507 3848 | F: 6507 3849

Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg
Anemamrm NSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice:

This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you
have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

From: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 14 April 2023 9:33 am

To: xinyu@lkkauto.com; Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (sur@lkkauto.com) <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: OD Claim for Vehicle YN 7194H - DOA 25/03/2023 - MFC REF: D23001166MFCV/PTE/OD

Dear Xin Yu,

My colleague, Chris Goh is handling the matter.

Hi Chris,

Fyna pls.



Best Regards,

Karew Taw

Motor Claims Dept.

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building Singapore 048581 | DID : 6507 3582 | Fax
No. : 6507 3849 | Company Regn. No. 195000106C

avember o [[XETRNE] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Xin Yu (LKK Auto) <xinyu@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, April 13, 2023 6:22 PM

To: Karen Tan <karentan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: OD Claim for Vehicle YN 7194H - DOA 25/03/2023 - MFC REF: D23001166MFCV/PTE/OD

Dear Karen,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle: YN 7194H
Date of survey: 12/04/2023
Number of days (estimated) : 10 days

We have Not authorise repair.

Part by Part Repair.

The Repairer is able to undertake to repair the vehicle for not more than $9,000.
Kindly let us have your approval and provides policy excess.

Best Regards,

Xin Yu | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | fax: 6256-4315 | email: xinyu@lkkauto.com / sur@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



