EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Ashlene Lee Bee Gan (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)
<BeeGan.Lee@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 22 May 2023 11:27 AM

To: CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: LOD - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF282B & SLM4798U ON 31/3/2023 ALONG TPE SLIP
ROAD TOWARDS PASIR RIS DR 8

Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; LAID UP REPORT REPORT.pdf; RENTAL PROOF.pdf; SAS.pdf

Our Ref: TAX/03/23/2079/AL

Dear Sir / Madam,

We claim on behalf of STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD, owner of the vehicle Reg. No.: SHF282B. Your driver’s negligent driving has
caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses:-

Cost of Repair $1,650.00
Loss of Rental $1,058.40 ( 10 daysx $105.84 )
Total $2,708.40

We enclose the following documents:
1) Repair Invoice
2) Proof of Rental Rate
3) SASreport
4) Laid up report

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Kindly issue payment in favour to STRIDES TAXI PTE LTD.

Regards,

aahlene

Ashlene Lee
Claim Department

Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd | 60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4 Singapore 757705
DID: 6866 2615 | Fax: 6368 7421 | Email: BeeGan.Lee@strides.com.sg | www.stridesmobility.com.sg
https://www.smrt.com.sg/Compliment
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DISCLAIMER This electronic mail message and any files transmitted with it are intended exclusively for the individual or
entity to which it is addressed. The message, together with any attachment, may contain confidential and/or privileged
information. Any unauthorized review, use, printing, saving, copying, disclosure or distribution is strictly prohibited.If
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Customer Code: 3000063

Strides Automotive Services Pte. Ltd.

2 Tanjong Katong Road, Tower 3, Paya
Lebar Quarter, #08-01, Singapore 437161
Tel: 65 69083530 Fax: 65 69083592

Tax Invoice

GST Reg No. MR-8500001-7

STRIDES TAXI PTE. LTD. CRN : 1990042807
Invoice No. Iv230500004
Block Unit Date : 03.05.2023
Vehicle No. SHF282B
60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 Your Ref No. TAX/03/23/2079
SINGAPORE 757705 Our Ref No. 24118086
Terms : 30 Days
Description Qty Unit Add / (Discount) Amount
Cost % Amount
LUMP SUM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR 1.00 S 1,650.00
AS PER SURVEYOR'S RECOMMENDATION
GRAND TOTAL S 1,650.00

Remark
Make/Model PRIUS4
Accident Date 31.03.2023

Payment Instructions
By Cheque: Crossed and made payable to "Strides

Automotive Services Pte. Ltd." with invoice no. indicated on

the reverse side. No receipt will be issued unless requested.

By Bank Transfer:
Account Name
Bank Name : DBS Bank Ltd - SGD
Bank Account No.: 018-008617-4

Swift Code : DBSSSGSG
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: Strides Automotive Services Pte. Ltd.

Koo Yew Chung

Koo Yew Chung (May 3, 202377:26 GMT+8)

Authorised Signature
for Strides Automotive Services Pte. Ltd.

E. & O.E
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Our Ref :TAX/03/23/2079/AL
Date :31/03/2023

To : Claims Department
From : Strides Taxi Pte Ltd

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHF282B & SLM4798U ON 31/03/2023 ALONG TPE SLIP
ROAD TO PASIRRISDR 8

CONFIRMATION OF TAXI RENTAL

This is to confirm the daily taxi rental rate for taxi registration no. SHF282B is
$105.84/day.

Kindly proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of this
accident.

Thankvou.
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Accident Start Date :

Accident End Date

01/04/2023
22/04/2023

Laid Up Report

Date Generated :

User Name

22/05/2023

LeeBeeGan

Case Reference Number | Vehicle Registration Company Type Vehicle Make Vehicle Model Job Card Number Date and Time Date and Time
Number (Accident Repair) (Repair Completed)
TAX/03/23/2079 SHF282B Strides Taxi Pte Ltd TOYOTA PRIUS4 24118086 03/04/2023 11:40 AM 13/04/2023 9:11 AM
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