Winnie Foo (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear All

Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 4 April 2023 2:41 pm

Sherwin Beh (LKK Auto); Accounts (LKK Auto); Winnie Foo (LKKAuto)
FW: YQ3730X / DOA 21 FEB 2023 /

AlG insured has requested a copy of our fire report. Please refer to email below.

@ Sherwin

Please re-print report with a new reference number attention to the following:-

AOP LOGISTICS (S) PTE. LTD.

2 FISHERY PORT ROAD

#03-10 CACHE COLD CENTRE

SINGAPORE 619746

@ Winnie

Please issue invoice at $80/- excluding gst.

@ Accounts

Please send our invoice and bank details to: huixin@aop-singapore.com.sg

Once payment receive, forward them the new report.

Best Regards,
Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Evelyn Chong <basins.agency@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 12:54 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>
Subject: Re: YQ3730X / DOA 21 FEB 2023 /

Hi Bryan,

The insured agreed to purchase the reports.
Kindly email and bill them directly : huixin@aop-singapore.com.sg

Insured details:
AOP LOGISTICS (S) PTE. LTD.
2 FISHERY PORT ROAD

#03-10 CACHE COLD CENTRE

SINGAPORE 619746

Warmest regards,
Evelyn Chong




BAS INSURANCE AGENCY
TEL: 6749 2112
FAX: 6742 6628
HP: 9757 6628

On Mon, Apr 3, 2023 at 5:43 PM Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Andy

We have no issue to produce the same report address to your insured. We will charge an administration
fee of $80 (excluding gst)

Aside to Basins Agency,

Please provide your client’s full address to be indicated in the report.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@]lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Fong, Andy-SY <Andy-SY.Fong@aig.com>
Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 5:02 PM

To: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>
Cc: basins.agency@gmail.com

Subject: YQ3730X / DOA 21 FEB 2023 /

Hi Bryan,

We refer to your fire investigation report CI/AIG23003015/P dated 23" March 2023. We have since engaged with
owner of AOP Logistics (S) Pte. Ltd. (“Insured”) and share the details of your report with him.

Insured is now requesting LKK to provide a copy of the report with attention to AOP Logistics (S) Pte. Ltd for their
consideration on the next appropriate course of action.



May you please advise if this is possible and if yes, the cost involved to insured. | have copied Insured’s representing
agency for their coordination with Insured

Thank you

Andy

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must
not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by
"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and
any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into
which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



