Xin Yu (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Saturday, April 22, 2023 12:04 AM

To: SUR; assignments; Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: SJQ5973B (SNM23D202401/CO1/LEEPG) - URGENT

Hi Xinyu

Please refer to our conversation on 21/4/23.
Please let us have amended invoice.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee
Claims Department

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 1:08 PM

To: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto)
<Naz@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJQ5973B (SNM23D202401/C01/LEEPG) - URGENT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Naz
New modification case assign to you.

Best Regards,

Bryan Ang

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: bryanang@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 9:51 AM

To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@|kkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A
<admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SJQ5973B (SNM23D202401/C01/LEEPG) - URGENT

Importance: High

Hi Bryan

Please proceed to conduct interview insured and put up modification report.



Thanks & Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee
Claims Department

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the
e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 9:40 AM

To: celinefong@Ikkauto.com; bryanang@lkkauto.com

Cc: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; cs-a@Ilkkauto.com; admin-

a@lkkauto.com
Subject: SJQ5973B (SNM23D202401/C01/LEEPG) - URGENT

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

This mail is associated with :
$JQ5973B (SNM23D202401/C01/LEEPG)
oD
Mar 30 2023 6:00PM
[CHIANG CHIAN WEE]
Ding Auto Pte Ltd
Hi Bryan/Celine

We refer to your Preliminary Advice dated 06/04/2023 where you suggest to carry out an interview & put up modification
report as the vehicle found with many modifications.

Please advise your fee charge of $400 (before GST) is including the attendant fee to FIDReC if insured lodged complaint?

Please revert soonest as possible.

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : Cecilia Lee (China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.)



