Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 12:18 PM

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg; assignments; Admin A

Cc: ‘Sandra (Gmail)'

Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D20872C02 ----- : Accident involving SKF 486 U and SDA 8665

B on 5 Dec 2022

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Completed

Dear Sir/Mdm (LKK]),
Please assist fo get your surveyor to liaise with K.KIM HIN to conduct survey.
Regards,

Irene Tay
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X P Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, March 28, 2023 5:47 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com>; service@kkimhin.com.sg

Subject: RE: CTP REF NO. SNM22D20872C01 ----- : Accident involving SKF 486 U and SDA 8665 B on 5 Dec 2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Irene

Can you appoint a surveyor for me? Can | choose LKK Kenneth?
Best Regards

Sandra

6452 7018
9622 2116



K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd

From: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Sunday, 26 March 2023 9:36 am

To: service@kkimhin.com.sg

Cc: 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com>

Subject: CTP REF NO. SNM22D20872C01 ----- : Accident involving SKF 486 U and SDA 8665 B on 5 Dec 2022

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Liability is down on our insured and we are prepared to do a direct settlement with you.
Regards,

Irene Tay
Claims Department (Motor Division)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896192 | F:(65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X Py Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may
contain confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately.
Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: service@kkimhin.com.sg <service@kkimhin.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 3:00 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: service@kkimhin.com.sg; 'Sandra (Gmail)' <sandrakhong@gmail.com>
Subject: Accident involving SKF 486 U and SDA 8665 B on 5 Dec 2022

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Your Ref: SDA 8665 B (China Taiping)
Our Ref: SKF 486 U

Dear Officer
Enclosed the GIA report SKF 486 U who was hit by SDA 8665 B on 5 Dec 2022.
Please assist to advise liability.

Thank you.



Best Regards

Sandra

6452 7018

9622 2116

K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd



