Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan <Jonnalyn.Romeo@hlas.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 4:23 pm

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor); assignments

Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: RE: OD SURVEY -SBM7333B, doa 30/3/23 (Policy no. MP307949) - HLAS's REF:
MPCO04076/RL

Dear June,

Excess is S$250.00. We appointed LKK to do the survey.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Lynn Romeo
Claims Executive

% HL Assurance

A Member of the Hong Leong Group

11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057
T +65 6922 6025 | F +65 6221 3782
jonnalyn.romeo@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg
Reaching out to you at Facebook | Twitter|Linkedin |

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 4:15 pm

To: HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>; Romeo Jonnalyn Alaan <Jonnalyn.Romeo@hlas.com.sg>
Subject: Re: OD SURVEY -SBM7333B, doa 30/3/23 (Policy no. MP307949) - HLAS's REF: MPC04076/RL
Hi Lyn,

Noted you are the claim handler of this case.

Estimate submitted through Merimen.
Kindly arrange for survey soonest as vehicle is lying at YISHUN WORKSHOP.

Please advise on the Excess applicable.

Thank you.

Rgds
June
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd



Tel : 67556142
Fax : 67557719
Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg

From: HLAS Claims

Sent: Monday, April 3, 2023 4:08 PM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Subject: RE: OD SURVEY -SBM7333B, doa 30/3/23 (Policy no. MP307949) - HLAS's REF: MPC04076/RL

Dear June,
We acknowledge receipt of your claim documents which will be forwarded to the claim handler accordingly.

For future subsequent emails, please direct to our claim officer in charge Ms Lynn who is copied in this email. Do quote
our reference number when replying.

Aside to Lynn - FYNA.

Regards,
Claims Department

¥ HL Assurance

A amigr of o Serg ey vy
11 Keppel Road #11-01, ABI Plaza, Singapore 089057
T +65 6922 6093 / F +65 6224 1923
claims@hlas.com.sg | www.hlas.com.sg

Important: Please note that acceptance and clearing of our settlement cheque/GIRO/PayNow payment constitutes
your acceptance of payment which will be in full and final settlement and discharge of all claims that you may have
against HL Assurance Pte. Ltd. and/or our insured whichever is applicable in respect of the above subject matter.

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) [mailto:chmotor@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 3 April 2023 1:25 pm

To: Grace Ng <grace.ng@hlas.com.sg>; HLAS Claims <claims@hlas.com.sg>
Subject: OD SURVEY -SBM7333B, doa 30/3/23 (Policy no. MP307949)

Hi,

Estimate submitted through Merimen.

Kindly arrange for survey soonest as vehicle is lying at YISHUN WORKSHOP.
Please advise on the Excess applicable.

Thank you.

Rgds



June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719



