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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 6 April 2023 11:09 AM
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore); Admin A
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SNC4579P and SNG9301U

Categories: HMK

Dear Shanti, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Repairer arrange on 10.4.23. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 / Whatsapp call: 87813698  | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 10:54 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Victor Wong <victorauto101@gmail.com> 
Subject: FW: Accident Involving SNC4579P and SNG9301U 
 

Internal 
 
 
Dear LKK 
  
We are appointing your good office as the SJE for the PRI of SNC4579P 
  
 Please be informed that said vehicle can be inspected at: 
  
 Victor Wong , 81821895 
 
AUTO 101 LLP , No. 2, Yishun Industrial St 1, 
Northpoint Bizhub, #02-01,  Spore 768159 
  
Please download the documents from this link below (For Survey) 

 File: SNG9301U OI.pdf, SNC4579P TP.pdf 

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=c72aebdd-d636-440a-8ba7-cc22e699633f-e317509e63039ba2 
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Size: ~ 4 MByte, Download available until: 4/11/2023  
Passwords will be sent in a separate email 
  
Best regards, 
  
Shanti.R 
Claims Service 
Claims & Performance Management 
  
Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte.Ltd. | UEN 201903913C  
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897  
Phone: +65 63958973 | www.allianz.sg 
 
 
 

From: Victor Wong <victorauto101@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, April 5, 2023 11:20 AM 
To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg> 
Cc: ron@auto101.com.sg 
Subject: [EXT] Accident Involving SNC4579P and SNG9301U 
 
Ref: 
 
Our client: SNC4579P 
Your Insured: SNG9301U 
 
 
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
 
The above attached is the GIA report from our client. 
 
May I request for  a PRS to be conducted on my client's vehicle ? 
 
In addition, may I check on the liability clearance of my client? 

Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
--  
Regards, 
Victor Wong 
81821895 
 
AUTO 101 LLP 
No. 2, Yishun Industrial St 1, 
Northpoint Bizhub, #02-01, 
Spore 768159 


