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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 May 2023 9:02 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L

CASE FINALISED 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.
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From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Monday, 8 May 2023 2:07 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Hi Rasul , 

 

We confirm acceptance of your offer $4150.00 @5days . 

 

Thanks, 

 

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, May 8, 2023 11:26 AM 

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Hi TiTi 
  

Refer to attachment 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $4,150.00 /- with 05 days of 

repair before GST, subject to their approval. 

  

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  
The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Monday, 17 April 2023 11:21 am 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Finalization <finalization@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Hi Rasul ,  

 

Kindly finalized amount for FBE9791R asap . 

 

Thanks 

 

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Monday, April 10, 2023 12:32 PM 

To: Lim Stewart <lim.stewart@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Cc: cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg <cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: Fw: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Hi ,  

 

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know 

whether the above motorcycle FBE9791R is authorized for 

direct settlement . 

  

Thank You 

  

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 

 

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Thursday, April 6, 2023 1:28 PM 

To: cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg <cheah.esther@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: Fw: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Hi ,  

 

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know 

whether the above motorcycle FBE9791R is authorized for 
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direct settlement . 

  

Thank You 

  

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 

 

 

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, April 4, 2023 2:09 PM 

To: Lim Stewart <lim.stewart@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: Fw: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

 

Hi Lim , 

 

We shall be much obliged if you would let us know 

whether the above motorcycle FBE9791R is authorized for 

direct settlement . 

  

Thank You 

  

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 

  

 

 

From: Work Shop Estimate (SG) <workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 12:51 PM 

To: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com> 

Cc: Work Shop Estimate (SG) <workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: FW: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm 

  

Please submit your client’s SAS accident report for our claim registration  

  
Regards 
Workshop Estimate 
  
  
  

From: Southern Motor <soumotorclaims@hotmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 11:53 AM 

To: Lim, Stewart <lim.stewart@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Cc: Work Shop Estimate (SG) <workshopestimate@libertyinsurance.com.sg> 

Subject: Third Party Claims -FBE9791R & YQ6744L 
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Hi , 

  

We are acting on behalf of FBE9791R . 

Kindly arrange survey for the motorcycle FBE9791R. 

  

  

Thank you 

  

Ti Ti 

Southern Motor 

6273-0369 
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