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EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 June 2023 7:35 pm
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: OFFER / Accident Involving SJE7122R & SJF38T on 25.03.2023 (Your Ref. : TBA) *** 

LKK REF: CC4/AIS23003146/Aya3

Dear Lyna, 
 
Please see below for bank details. 
 
Please assist to effect payment soonest. 
 

Company Name  JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd. 
Company Registration Number 202136905K 
 

Company Address 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, 
#08-09 Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 415875 

Bank Name DBS Bank 

Bank Account Number 072-490501-7 

Bank Code 7171 

Branch Code 072 

Bank Branch Raffles Place 

Swift Code DBSSSGSG 

Email Address jlperfectautowork@gmail.com  

 

Thank You. 

  

Regards, 

Joanne 

Mobile: 97231055 

JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd. 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09 
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Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 415875 
 
 
On Fri, Jun 30, 2023 at 5:41 PM EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

Solely for purposes of amicable settlement, we are agreeable to resolve the matter at S$4,800.00 (all in) in full and 
final settlement of all claims your client has or may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore and/or their insured 
arising out of this incident.  

  

If the above offer is accepted, kindly confirm settlement by providing a copy of the Letter of Authorization / Warrant 
to Act  and your Bank details for us to process payment.   

  

Please note that your client’s receipt of the settlement sum or settlement sums shall constitute a full discharge of 
liability and waiver of any past, present or future claims your client may have against Allianz Insurance Singapore 
and/or our insured as a result of the accident on 25-Mar-2023.  

  

Please note that the clearance of this cheque / settlement sum or receipt of the successful electronic payment or 
payments constitutes your client’s acceptance of payment and full discharge of liability. 

  

*Kindly provide BANK DETAILS to effect payment. 

  

Thank you.  

  

Warmest Regards,  

Ezlyna 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

  

is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not 
the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to others and 
notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you. 

  

  

From: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 27, 2023 7:13 PM 
To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: OFFER / Accident Involving SJE7122R & SJF38T on 25.03.2023 (Your Ref. : TBA) *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIS23003146/Aya3 

  

Dear Lyna, 

  

We confirm settlement @ $4800.00 (For Property Claims Only) as per laid out by you. 

  

Please let us have your DV (If Ant) to effect payment soonest possible. 

  

  

Thank You. 

  

Regards, 

Joanne 

Mobile: 97231055 

JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd. 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09 

Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 415875 
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On Tue, Jun 27, 2023 at 3:51 PM EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Joanne, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have our principal’s instruction to offer at Global Sum $4,800.00 (All In) for an amicable settlement. 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance & E-voucher will follow shortly.  Thank you. 

  

With warmest regards, 

Ezlyna 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

  

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2023 12:15 PM 
To: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>; EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJE7122R & SJF38T on 25.03.2023 (Your Ref. : TBA) *** LKK REF: 
CC4/AIS23003146/Aya3 

  

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

Thank you for your email. 
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Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

  

Hi Lyna, 

  

Kindly assist. 

  

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: JL Perfect Autowork <jlperfectautowork@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, May 18, 2023 11:00 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Accident Involving SJE7122R & SJF38T on 25.03.2023 (Your Ref. : TBA) 

  

 
 

Dear OIC, 
 

  

Please see attached LOD for your actions. 
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Thank You. 

  

Regards, 

Joanne 

Mobile: 97231055 

JL Perfect Autowork Pte. Ltd. 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #08-09 

Premier @ Kaki Bukit 

Singapore 415875 

  

  


