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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 27 March 2023 3:20 PM
To: ENG HUEY NI
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; EzLyna (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 

17/03/2023 // Our Ref: 23/23/23/VC05/027140 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC23003128/ya3

Dear Huey Ni, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please provide us TP supp doc and OI’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Our case handler in-charge is Lyna. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 2:50 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 // Our Ref: 
23/23/23/VC05/027140 
 
Dear Gerald, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Yan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 2:36 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com> 
Subject: FW: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 // Our Ref: 
23/23/23/VC05/027140 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Meng Yan, 
 
FYNA. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>  
Sent: Monday, March 27, 2023 2:14 PM 
To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 // Our Ref: 
23/23/23/VC05/027140 
 
Dear Huey Ni, 
 
Kindly arrange to survey the vehicle tomorrow 28/03/2023 after 1030am.. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
____________________________________________ 
Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com 
 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 
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From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 5:37 PM 
To: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 // Our Ref: 
23/23/23/VC05/027140 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Hi Sam, 
 
We have just replied you today at 2.42pm: 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>  
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 3:05 PM 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 
 
Dear Gerald, 
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Is your insured make the report? 
 
Hope to hear from you soon. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
____________________________________________ 
Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com 
 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 
 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 2:00 PM 
To: sam@sngahtee.com 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Our Ref: TBA 
 
Dear Sam, 
 
Our insured has not lodged the report and we are unable to comment on liability. 
 
Please let us know if a survey of your vehicle is required at this juncture. 
 
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: SAMANTHA TAN <sam@sngahtee.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, March 21, 2023 1:43 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Ong Li Li Forwarding Email <llong@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Accident involved with our client's vehicle SMU1426J your insured GBJ2165T on 17/03/2023 
 
Hi, 
  
We refer to above and wish to check liability for this case. 
  
Hope to hear from you soon. 
  
Thank you. 
 
 
 
Best Regards 
____________________________________________ 
Samantha Tan | sam@sngahtee.com 
 
SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457 
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com 

 
 
 


