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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 21 June 2023 5:26 PM
To: Lau
Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive); Admin A
Subject: RE: CC2/MIDF23003125/Tp-accident involving GBK1205M & 41629MID ( yr insured 

) on 16 Jan 2023
Attachments: DV_GBK1205M.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,  
 
Thank you for your acceptance.  
  
We confirm settlement at $4,450.00(all-in).  
  
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
Please let us have your company bank details for payment processing. 
 

Account Name    
Account Number    
Bank Name    
Bank & Branch Code    

 

Thank you.  
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, June 20, 2023 11:35 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: CC2/MIDF23003125/Tp-accident involving GBK1205M & 41629MID ( yr insured ) on 16 Jan 2023 
 
Hi 
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Please let us have the DV.  
 
Thank you 
Ms Lau 
Tel: 8188 4136 
Connect 3  
566 Woodlands Road 
(Mandai Estate) S 728697 
 
 
On Wed, Jun 14, 2023 at 10:42 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi 
 
Please let us have the DV.  
 
Thank you 
Ms Lau 
Tel: 8188 4136 
Connect 3  
566 Woodlands Road 
(Mandai Estate) S 728697 
 
 
On Fri, Jun 9, 2023 at 5:00 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong.  
 
We refer to the email below.  
 
We accept the offer.  
 
Please let us have the DV.  
 
Thank you 
Ms Lau 
Tel: 8188 4136 
Connect 3  
566 Woodlands Road 
(Mandai Estate) S 728697 
 
 
On Fri, Jun 9, 2023 at 4:57 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Apologised for late response. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 4,050.00  

2. Loss of Use (5days x $80.00  $    400.00  

Total  $ 4,450.00  

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, June 7, 2023 12:05 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) 
<connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: CC2/MIDF23003125/Tp-accident involving GBK1205M & 41629MID ( yr insured ) on 16 Jan 2023 

  

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 
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Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 

  

  

On Thu, May 25, 2023 at 3:15 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 

  

  

On Fri, May 19, 2023 at 11:31 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
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We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 

  

  

On Thu, May 11, 2023 at 10:07 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 
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On Wed, May 3, 2023 at 10:42 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 

  

  

On Thu, Apr 20, 2023 at 11:56 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 
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On Wed, Apr 12, 2023 at 3:23 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the email dated 28 Mar 2023 

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 

Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 

  

  

On Tue, Mar 28, 2023 at 3:24 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

We refer to the above matter.  

  

Attached is the Tax invoice, LOD and LOA.  

  

Please let us have your offer.  

  

Thank you 

Ms Lau 
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Tel: 8188 4136 

Connect 3  

566 Woodlands Road 

(Mandai Estate) S 728697 


