3/24/23, 6:35 PM Mail - Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: RE: Check Liability & Arrange for TP survey - Accident Involving SMP834Y (TLM)
and SMF205R (Allianz) DOA: 18/03/2023

Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>
Fri 24/3/2023 5:23 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>;Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Dear Shanti,

Thank you for the assignment.

Repairer arrange on 27.3.23.

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 5:01 PM

To: timautomobile@tlmotor.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: RE: Check Liability & Arrange for TP survey - Accident Involving SMP834Y (TLM) and SMF205R
(Allianz) DOA: 18/03/2023

Importance: High

Internal

Your ref: SMP834Y
Our ref: SMF205R

Dear Sirs,

We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.

Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

TLM Automobile Pte Ltd
Kelvin, Phone: 6858 5151 Ext: 801, 1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539365
Email: timautomobile@tlmotor.com.sg

File: SMP834Y(TP).pdf, SMF205R OLpdf

Link: https://filexchange.allianz.de/SecureDownload.aspx?id=349fb4b1-bced-42e0-ab14-6ad400022a52-
28612b5dd98be373
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Size: ~ 3 MByte, Download available until: 3/29/2023
Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R

Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 I Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQO | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralympdc Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and /

or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose
the contents of

this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any
copies of it.

Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: timautomobile@tImotor.com.sg <tlmautomobile@tlmotor.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 3:39 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: timautomobile@tImotor.com.sg

Subject: [EXT] RE: Check Liability & Arrange for TP survey - Accident Involving SMP834Y (TLM) and SMF205R
(Allianz) DOA: 18/03/2023

Importance: High

Hi Shanti,

Our propose surveyor list : LKK Auto
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Kelvin

TLM Automobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6858 5151 Ext: 801

Fax: 6858 0877

1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539365
Email: timautomobile@tImotor.com.sg
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From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, March 24, 2023 1:17 PM

To: timautomobile@tlmotor.com.sg

Subject: FW: Check Liability & Arrange for TP survey - Accident Involving SMP834Y (TLM) and SMF205R (Allianz)
DOA: 18/03/2023

Importance: High

Internal

Your Ref: SMP834Y
Our Ref: SMF205R

Dear Sirs

Enclosed is the list of surveyors for your consideration for Single Joint Expert (SJE):-

e AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd
e Form Team Consultancy Pte Ltd
e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us know who you are agreeable to appoint from the list.

Best regards,

Shanti

Claims & Performance Management Department

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 Singapore 068897

www.allianz.sg

QQPL | Altianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Porolympdc Posbner

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the
contents of this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.
Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: timautomobile@tImotor.com.sg <tlmautomobile@tlmotor.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 4:38 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Cc: timautomobile @tImotor.com.sg
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Subject: [EXT] Check Liability & Arrange for TP survey - Accident Involving SMP834Y (TLM) and SMF205R (Allianz)

DOA: 18/03/2023
Importance: High
Your Ref: SMP834Y
Our Ref: SMF205R
DOA: 18.03.2023
Without Prejudice

Dear All,

We refer to the above matter.

Please arrange for survey, Vehicle not at our our premises.

Pursuant to paragraph 2.3 of Pre-Action Protocol for NIMA Cases, please let us have a list of 10 motor surveyors for
our selection and please let us know within 2 working days whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of our
client’s vehicle. If we do not hear from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle
without further reference to you.

In the event that you request for post repair inspection pursuant to paragraph 4.1 under the NIMA Protocol, you must
compensate our client for the loss of use of his/her vehicle for the day that the inspection is conducted.

In addition, please confirm in writing whether you are agreeable to direct settle with us at 100% liability for this case.

Thank you
Best Regards,
Kelvin

TLM Automobile Pte Ltd

Phone: 6858 5151 Ext: 801

Fax: 6858 0877

1 Defu Lane 6 Singapore 539365

Email: timautomobile@tIlmotor.com.sg
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