3/24/23, 11:03 PM Mail - Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: THIRD PARTY - YOUR REF: SJH5445G / OUR REF: SML5277T

Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>
Fri 24/3/2023 9:44 AM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>;Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Dear Shantj,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Yan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 8:06 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: THIRD PARTY - YOUR REF: SJH5445G / OUR REF: SML5277T

Internal

Your ref: SML5277T
Our ref: 2023 32006267FR-GK-SJH5445G

Dear Sirs,
We hereby appoint our direct settlement partners LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct survey.
Kindly engage with them to arrange for survey.

Lim Teng Keat

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042
Tel. +65 9349 1174 | tengkeat.lim@eurokars.com.sg

Thank you.

Best regards,

Shanti. R
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Claims Service

Allianz Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. | UEN 201903913C
79 Robinson Road #09-01 | Singapore 068897

Phone: +65 6395 3836 | www.allianz.sg

QQO | Allianz @ | (.

Warldwide Olymplc ond Poralympdc Postner

This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and /
or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of
this communication to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it.

Thank you.

&5 Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, March 23, 2023 5:34 PM

To: Motor Claims (Allianz Insurance Singapore) <claims@allianz.com.sg>

Cc: Jerome Tan Zhe Lun <jerome.tan.zl@eurokars.com.sg>; Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul
Glorioso <eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Tan Wei Cin <weicin.tan@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong
<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian <junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng
<yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Mandy Giam <mandy.giam.yx@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL - Claims Admin
<claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>

Subject: [EXT] THIRD PARTY - YOUR REF: SJH5445G / OUR REF: SML5277T

Dear Officers,

Kindly arrange the survey of our client’s vehicle ASAP at 27A Tanjong Penjuru, CAR IN.
Attached is the ESTIMATE & ACCIDENT REPORT for your perusal.

We would appreciate it if you can kindly let us know the liability / status of this case.
Thank you

Lim Teng Keat

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042

Tel. +65 9349 1174 | tengkeat.lim@eurokars.com.sg

EurokarsGroup.com | EurokarsGroupSGLinkedin

The contents of this email and attachments herein are strictly confidential. It may contain privileged
information and is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom the email is addressed. If
you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately by replying to this message and
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then delete it from your system. Do not read, copy, use or circulate this communication. Internet
communications are not secure. While every reasonable effort has been made to ensure that this
communication has not been tampered with Trans Eurokars Pte Ltd and its affiliates is not responsible
for alterations made to the contents of this message without its express consent. Any individual or entity
who communicates with us is taken to have accepted these risks. In providing personal data to us, you
consent to us using it for the purposes set out in https://www.eurokarsgroup.com/data-protection/.
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