Meng Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 March 2023 9:02 AM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Teo Jie Yang; Don Bong

Subject: TPPD survey: Claim ref: C10021124 /JY || Ol- SID3844Y (Grey) TP-SNB6040T|| Est:
$0.00 || Optima Werkz PL

Attachments: C10021124 - TP (SNB6040T).zip

Hi Team,

We would like to request TP survey for SNB6040T. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:

Ary Chua
Motor Claims Admin Officer

OPT/MAERHKZ creuo.

Head Office: B Kung Chong Road Singapore 158143 Tel: (+85) 8472 1313  Fax: (+85) 8472 a2
Branch; 84 Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel: (+55) 6484 9818 Fax; (+85) 5481 18983
Branch: Blk 10 Aang Mo Kio Ind Park 24 #01-08/068 Singapore 868047  Tel: (+65) 6481 1522 Fax: (+65) 8481 1011

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Admin Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 March 2023 5:14 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Eng Aun (Simon) Koh <simon.koh@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Kaitlyn Chio
<kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Victor Seng
<victor.seng@ow.sg>

Subject: RE: PRI Request on 21.03.2023 | | C10021124/JY || PRI - SNB6040T CLAIM AGAINST SLD3844Y (AGI/BD)
DOA: 18/03/2023

Dear Frauleine Khoo,
We Choose the below surveyor;
3. LKK-Auto

Thank you.

Best regards

Ary Chua

Motor Claims Admin Officer

OPT/MALHERHKZ ere.mo.

Head Office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 Fax: (+65) 6472 2112
Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 Fax: (+65) 6481 1993
Branch: Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A #01-05/06 Singapore 568047 Tel: (+65) 6481 1522 Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Ary Chua <ary.chua@ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 21 March 2023 3:28 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Eng Aun (Simon) Koh <simon.koh@ow.sg>; Mohamed Nashik <mohamed.nashik@ow.sg>; Kaitlyn Chio
<kaitlyn.chio@ow.sg>; Ling Ting An <tingan.ling@ow.sg>; Joseph Low <joseph@ow.sg>; Victor Seng
<victor.seng@ow.sg>

Subject: PRI - SNB6040T CLAIM AGAINST SLD3844Y (AGI/BD) DOA: 18/03/2023

Dear Motor Claims Department,

Kindly arrange PRI at 10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A #01-05 AMK Autopoint S568047. * Vehicle Not In Workshop

*

Thank you.

Best regards

Ary Chua

Motor Claims Admin Officer

OPT/MALHERHKZ ere.mo.

Head Office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 Fax: (+65) 6472 2112
Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 Fax: (+65) 6481 1993
Branch: Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A #01-05/06 Singapore 568047 Tel: (+65) 6481 1522 Fax: (+65) 6481 1011



