Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 20 July 2023 5:00 PM

Legiste Law Corporation

RE: ACCIDENT ON 17.03.22 INVOLVING SKM 9535R & MID 33853 AT CHOA CHU
KANG CAMP CAR PARK [FMC.12827.23.45]

DV_SKM9535R pdf

We confirm settlement at $3,648.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please let us have your company bank details for payment processing.

Account Name

Account Number

Bank Name

Bank & Branch Code

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Legiste Law Corporation <advocates@legiste.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, July 20, 2023 1:04 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 17.03.22 INVOLVING SKM 9535R & MID 33853 AT CHOA CHU KANG CAMP CAR PARK

[FMC.12827.23.45]

Your Ref: MID 33853 / Date of accident: 17.3.23

Our Ref: FMC.12827.23.45

Without Prejudice



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong

We refer to your email dated 19t July 2023 set out below.
We have instructions to accept your offer of $3,648.00 (all in).

Kindly let us know whether you/your Principal will require our client to sign a Discharge Voucher to conclude the
settlement.

Best Regards,

Joseph Fok

Legiste Law Corporation

133 New Bridge Road

#11-01 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6227-9909

Fax: 6227-2767

Email: advocates@legiste.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, July 19, 2023 9:23 AM

To: Legiste Law Corporation <advocates@legiste.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 17.03.22 INVOLVING SKM 9535R & MID 33853 AT CHOA CHU KANG CAMP CAR PARK
[FMC.12827.23.45]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 2,150.00
2. Loss of Use (5days x $100.00) S 500.00
3. Survey Report Fee S 548.00
4. Costs Contribution $ 450.00

Total | $ 3,648.00

Please confirm. Thanks.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)




From: Legiste Law Corporation <advocates@legiste.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, July 17, 2023 3:02 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 17.03.22 INVOLVING SKM 9535R & MID 33853 AT CHOA CHU KANG CAMP CAR PARK
[FMC.12827.23.45]

Your Ref: MID 33853 / Date of accident: 17.3.23
Our Ref: FMC.12827.23.45

Without Prejudice

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Attn: Ms Chew Hsiao Tong

We refer to your email dated 14 July 2023.

We have instructions to counter-propose settlement as follows:

1. Cost of Repair $2,500.00
2. Loss of Use (as proposed by you) S 500.00
3. Survey Report Fee (agreed) S 548.00
4. Legal Costs Contribution (OC due) S 550.00
5. Incidental disbursements $ 50.00

Total | $4,148.00

Kindly let us have your confirmation of a settlement as aforesaid and your Discharge Voucher, if one is required, as
soon as possible.

Best Regards,

Joseph Fok

Legiste Law Corporation

133 New Bridge Road

#11-01 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6227-9909

Fax: 6227-2767

Email: advocates@legiste.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, July 14, 2023 8:20 AM

To: Legiste Law Corporation <advocates@legiste.com.sg>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT ON 17.03.22 INVOLVING SKM 9535R & MID 33853 AT CHOA CHU KANG CAMP CAR PARK
[FMC.12827.23.45]

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 2,000.00
2. Loss of Use (5days x $100.00) S 500.00
3. Survey Report Fee S 548.00
4. Costs Contribution $ 350.00
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Total | $ 3,398.00

Please confirm acceptance.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




